ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-16-200J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2015 thru September 30, 2015

DISTRICT ONE LOCATIONS

Opening Date: 5/12/2015

Page 1 of 10 Pages

Invoicing Information:
District 1 Headquarters
P.O. Box 278
Wynne, Arkansas 72396
Phone - (870) 238-8144

Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114
Tony Frizzell- (800) 723-0309

Pretreated Rock Salt

Item 1 Item 2
Palletized Per Bag Bulk Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS 23 Tons
LOCATIONS COUNTY
11 Area Headquarters Cross
Hwy. 284, Wynne 72396 110.00
122 Area Headquarters Lee
Hwy. 79, Marianna 72360 113.00
_, |AreaHeadquarters (Walnut Corner) -
-3 [y, 49, Barton 72312 Phillips 114.00
Area Headquarters
14 Tooplar st., McCrory 72101 Woodruff 110.00
Area Headquarters
15 1wy, 70, Brinkley 72021 Monroe 114.00
Area Headquarters .
16 11wy, 70, Forrest City 72335 St. Francis 112.00
Area Headquarters .
17 1wy, 70, West Memphis 72201 Crittenden 110.00
Area Headquarters .
18 11wy, 63, Gilmore 72339 Crittenden 108.00

DENOTES NO BID REQUESTED

TENTATIVELY AWARDED BY: Purchasing Committee

AWARDED TO: Oakley Fertilizer, Inc. (6/2/2015)

DATE: 5/27/2015
Card No. 07-01




Date of Contract: July 1, 2015 thru September 30, 2015

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-16-200J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS
DISTRICT TWO LOCATIONS

Page 2 of 10 Pages

Opening Date: 5/12/2015

Invoicing Information:
District 2 Headquarters
P.O. Box 6836

Pine Bluff, Arkansas 71611
Phone - (870) 534-1612

Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114
Tony Frizzell- (800) 723-0309

Pretreated Rock Salt

Hwy. 65 South, Pine Bluff 71611

Item 1 Item 2
Palletized Per Bag Bulk Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
22 Tons
LOCATIONS COUNTY
21 District 2 Headquarters Jefferson

5.25

DENOTES NO BID REQUESTED



ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-16-200J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS
DISTRICT THREE LOCATIONS

Page 3 of 10 Pages
Date of Contract: July 1, 2015 thru September 30, 2015 Opening Date: 5/12/2015
Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
Invoicing Information: 3700 East Lincoln Avenue
District 3 Headquarters North Little Rock, AR 72114
P.O. Box 490 Tony Frizzell- (800) 723-0309
Hope, Arkansas 71802
Phone - (870) 777-3457
Pretreated Rock Salt
Item 1 Item 2
Palletized Per Bag Bulk Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
23 Tons
LOCATIONS COUNTY
District 3 Headquarters
31 1wy, 29, Hope 71801 Hempstead 126.00
Area Headquarters
32 1wy, 371, Nashville 71852 Howard 131.00
Area Headquarters . .
33 |N. Constitution, Ashdown 71822 Liule River 135,00
Area Headquarters .
34 Blackman Ferry Rd., Texarkana 71854 Miller 132.00
Area Headquarters
35 lhwy. 371, Prescott 71857 Nevada 125.00
Area Headquarters .
36w, Main, Murfreesboro 71958 Pike 127.00

DENOTES NO BID REQUESTED



Date of Contract: July 1, 2015 thru September 30, 2015

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-16-200J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT FOUR LOCATIONS

Opening Date: 5/12/2015

Page 4 of 10 Pages

Invoicing Information:
District 4 Headquarters
P.O. Box 11170
Fort Smith, Arkansas 72917-1170
Phone - (501) 646-5501

Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114
Tony Frizzell- (800) 723-0309

Pretreated Rock Salt

Item 1 Item 2
Palletized Per Bag Bulk Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
23 Tons
LOCATIONS COUNTY
Area Headquarters .
41 1308 Frontier Road, Barling 72923 Sebastian 118.00
4-2 Sub Headquarters, 1-540 Exit 9 Sebastian
N.W. Corner, Fort Smith 72917 117.00
Area Headquarters .
43 lgim Street, Greenwood 72936 Sebastian 120.00
Area Headquarters
44 ltwy. 64, Van Buren 72956 Crawford 116.00
Area Headquarters
45 110435 Dollard Rd., Mountainburg 72946 Crawford 117.00
Area Headquarters .
46 |N. 18th Street, Ozark 72949 Franklin 110.00
4.7 Area Headquarters Logan
W. Walnut, Paris 72855 9 110.00
Area Headquarters
48 | wy. 71, Mena 72953 Polk 121.00
Area Headquarters
49 15 Main, Waldron 72958 Scott 115.00
Area Headquarters .
4-10" |\ pridemore, Lincoln 72744 Washington 126.00
Area Headquarters .
411 1wy, 112, Fayetteville 72704 Washington 123.00
Area Headquarters .
412 11wy, 71, West Fork 72774 Washington 121.00
Sub Headquarters .
4-13 | Adjacent to E. Side of I-49, Winslow Washington 120.00

DENOTES NO BID REQUESTED




Date of Contract: July 1, 2015 thru September 30, 2015

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-16-200J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS
DISTRICT FIVE LOCATIONS

Page 5 of 10 Pages

Opening Date: 5/12/2015

Invoicing Information:
District 5 Headquarters
P.O. Box 2376
Batesville, Arkansas 72503
Phone - (870) 251-2374

Oakley Eertilizer, Inc.

3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114
Tony Frizzell- (800) 723-0309

Pretreated Rock Salt

Item 1 Item 2
Palletized Per Bag Bulk Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
22T 23 T

LOCATIONS COUNTY
51 aii;r.iTei,HBe:tcjeitj/ﬁrlfrgssol Independence
52 Q;Zigesgﬂuﬁfif Springs 72543 Cleburne
53 Qrﬁa?rf Z(:.(Tusagg:rsm 72576 Fulton
54 fnr;igfadl\%?&eﬁne 72556 Izard
55 ﬁgedi/kggsgusgfrilewport 72112 Jackson
56 ﬁ\rﬁ;jHﬁZﬁgga E::Zy 72542 Sharp
57 ?;?aamkéizd:\ljg.r,t ?\;St View 72560 Stone
5.8 Area Headquarters White

E. Line Rd., Searcy 72143

114.00

110.00

113.00

113.00

111.00

111.00

111.00

110.00

DENOTES NO BID REQUESTED




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-16-200J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS
DISTRICT SIX LOCATIONS

Page 6 of 10 Pages
Date of Contract: July 1, 2015 thru September 30, 2015 Opening Date: 5/12/2015
Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
Invoicing Information: 3700 East Lincoln Avenue
District 6 Headquarters North Little Rock, AR 72114
P.O. Box 190296 Tony Frizzell- (800) 723-0309
Little Rock, Arkansas 72219
Phone - (501) 569-2266 Pretreated Rock Salt
Item 1 Item 2
Palletized Per Bag Bulk Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
23 Tons
LOCATIONS COUNTY
Area Headquarters
6-1 9001 Mabelvale Pike Pulaski
Little Rock 72209 107.00
Area Headquarters
6-2 |Eureka Garden Road Pulaski
North Little Rock 72117 107.00
Area Headquarters .
6-3 Shamburger Lane, Little Rock 72206 Pulaski 107.00
Area Headquarters
6-4 | Albert Pike, Hot Springs 71913 Garland 114.00
Area Headquarters .
6-5 Oliver Lancaster Blvd., Malvern 72104 Hot Spring 114.00
Area Headquarters
66 |\iwy. 31, Lonoke 72086 Lonoke 110.00
6-7 Area Headquarters Prairie
Orlicek St., Hazen 72064 113.00
Area Headquarters .
68 |\iwy. 67, Benton 72015 Saline 110.00

DENOTES NO BID REQUESTED




Date of Contract: July 1, 2015 thru September 30, 2015

DISTRICT SEVEN LOCATIONS

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-16-200J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

Page 7 of 10 Pages

Opening Date: 5/12/2015

Invoicing Information:
District 7 Headquarters
P.O. Box 897
Camden, Arkansas 71711
Phone - (870) 836-6401

Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114
Tony Frizzell- (800) 723-0309

Pretreated Rock Salt

Item 1 Item 2

Palletized Per Bag Bulk Per Ton

MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS

— LOCATIONS COUNTY
1 ZDZIZtSH(C::taiigfsidaqxir;iramden 71701 Ovachita
72 | o 1101
-3 C\Ir.e;g/?]ﬁglsjiir,sArkadelphia 71923 Clark

T | e
75 . 70 Rson 71665 clovetand
7-6 '-?gs?o?aanga&?;nolia 71753 Columbia
7 | 5. Fordyes 71742 el

-8 é;ﬁ:eiiiq;?:tgfmrado 71730 Union

-9 ?ggaHl-\:\?;dg?gr\t;\a/tsWarren 71671 Bradiey

DENOTES NO BID REQUESTED




Date of Contract: July 1, 2015 thru September 30, 2015

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-16-200J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS
DISTRICT EIGHT LOCATIONS

Opening Date: 5/12/2015

Page 8 of 10 Pages

Invoicing Information:
District 8 Headquarters
P.O. Box 70
Russellville, Arkansas 72811
Phone - (501) 968-2286

Oakley Eertilizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114
Tony Frizzell- (800) 723-0309

Pretreated Rock Salt

Item 1 Item 2
Palletized Per Bag Bulk Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
22 Tons 23 Tons
LOCATIONS COUNTY
8-1 District 8 Headquarters Pope
Aspen Lane, Russellville 72801 5.25
8-2 Area Headquarters Pope
Hob Nob Rd., Russellville 72801 5.25 106.00
8-3 Area Headquarters Conway
Hwy. 64 West, Morrilton 72110 5.25 102.00
Area Headquarters
84 I wy. 64 East, Conway 72032 Faulkner 106.00
Twin Groves Salt Facility
8-5 [Intersection Ozark Rd/Hwy. 65 Faulkner
Twin Groves, AR 106.00
Area Headquarters
86 |w. main, Clerksville 72830 Johnson 5.25 110.00
8-7 Area Headquarters Montgomery
Hwy. 270, Pencil Bluff 71965 5.25 114.00
g.g |AreaHeadquarters Perry _
Aplin Ave, Perryville 72126 106.00
Area Headquarters
89 lhwy. 95, Clinton 72031 Van Buren 106.00
Botkinburg Salt Facility
8-10 |2 mi N. of Botkinburg North Van Buren
Intersection with Hwy. 65 106.00
Area Headquarters
811 |y, 27, Danville 72833 vell 106.00
Plainview Salt Facility
8-12 28118 S. State Hwy. 27 Yell
Plainview 72857 110.00

DENOTES NO BID REQUESTED



ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-16-200J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS
DISTRICT NINE LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2015 thru September 30, 2015

Page 9 of 10 Pages
Opening Date: 5/12/2015

Invoicing Information:
District 9 Headquarters
P.O. Box 610
Harrison, Arkansas 72602
Phone - (870) 743-2100

Oakley IEertiIizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114
Tony Frizzell- (800) 723-0309

Pretreated Rock Salt

Item 1 Item 2
Palletized Per Bag Bulk Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
23 Tons

LOCATIONS COUNTY

9-1 District 8 Headquarters Boone
Hwy. 65, Harrison 72601 117.00

9-2 Area Headquarters Boone
Airport Rd., Harrison 72601 117.00
Area Headquarters

93 lnwy. 72, Garfield 72732 Benton 131.00
Area Headquarters

94 IN. Gentry Blvd., Gentry 72734 Benton 128.00
Area Headquarters

95 Iy, 143, Berryville 72616 Carroll 124.00
Area Headquarters .

96 I\ iwy. 412, Huntsville 72740 Madison 129.00
Area Headquarters .

%7 lhwy. 62, Yellville 72687 Marion 117.00
Area Headquarters

98 |\ iwy. 74, Jasper 72641 Newton 120.00

9-9 Area Headquarters Searc
Hwy. 27, Marshall 72650 Y 110.00
Sub Headquarters

9-10 |[I-49, Exit 83, SH 94 @ Champion Dr. Benton
Rogers 72756 127.00
Area Headquarters

911 11wy, 5, Mt. Home 72653 Baxter 119.00

DENOTES NO BID REQUESTED




Date of Contract: July 1, 2015 thru September 30, 2015

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-16-200J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT TEN LOCATIONS

Page 10 of 10 Pages

Opening Date: 5/12/2015

Invoicing Information:
District 10 Headquarters
P.O. Box 98
Paragould, Arkansas 72451
Phone - (870) 239-9511

Oakley Eertilizer, Inc.

3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114
Tony Frizzell- (800) 723-0309

Pretreated Rock Salt

Item 1 Item 2
Palletized Per Bag Bulk Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
23 Tons
LOCATIONS COUNTY
District 10 Headquarters
10-1 |\ Monroe St., Paragould 72450 Greene 106.00
Area Headquarters
102 1\ missouri Ave, Corning 72422 Clay 107.00
Area Headquarters .
10-3 Commerce Dr., Joneshoro 72401 Craighead 107.00
10-4 Area Headquarters Lawrence
Hwy. 412, Walnut Ridge 72476 108.00
Area Headquarters T
105 {5 County Rd. 503, Osceola 72370 Mississippi 106.00
Area Headquarters .
106 | 1wy. 149, Tyronza 72386 Poinsett 108.00
Area Headquarters
10-7 1wy, 115, Pocahontas 72455 Randolph 109.00
Area Headquarters - Miss. 11 .
108 |E Hwy. 18, Blytheville 72315 Blytheville 105.00

DENOTES NO BID REQUESTED




