ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS
DISTRICT ONE LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 1 of 30 Pages
Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Scotwood Industries Inc. Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
Invoicing Information: 12980 Metcalf Ave. Suite 240 3700 East Lincoln Avenue
District 1 Headquarters Overland Park, KS 66213 North Little Rock, AR 72114
P.O. Box 278 Allie Mahoney 800-844-2022 Tony Frizzell/Luke Vance (800) 723-0309
Wynne, Arkansas 72396 Fax 913-851-3377 Fax 501-945-6970
Phone - (870) 238-8144
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu-Jm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged [**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS o5 295 22 23 29 23
LOCATIONS COUNTY
11 District Headquarters Cross
Hwy. 64 West, Wynne 72396 488.00 215.00 200.00
12 Area Headquarters Cross
Hwy. 284, Wynne 72396 225.49 120.00 98.00
Sub Headquarters
1-3 [Hwy. 77, Approx. 1 mi. S. of Gilmore Crittenden
Gilmore, AR 72339 228.94 120.00 106.00
Area Headquarters .
L4 1wy, 70, Lehi 72301 Crittenden 228.72 120.00 105.00
15 Area Headquarters Lee
Hwy. 79, Marianna 72396 224.16 120.00 97.00
16 Area Headquarters Monroe
Hwy. 70, Brinkley 72021 218.65 120.00 95.00
17 Area Headquarters Phillips
Hwy. 49 (Walnut Corner) 72355 225.87 120.00 99.00
18 Area Headquarters St Francis
Hwy. 70, Forrest City 72335 ' 223.78 120.00 97.00
Area Headquarters
19 |hwy. 648, McCrory 72101 Woodruff 221.69 120.00 97.00
DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS. TENTATIVELY AWARDED BY: Purchasing Committee DATE: 5/23/2016

** Shrink Wrapped

AWARDED TO:
AWARDED TO:
AWARDED TO:
AWARDED TO:

Compass Minerals America, Inc. - As per Tabulation (6/1/2016)

Oakley Fertilizer, Inc. - As per Tabulation (6/2/2016)

Cargill, Inc. Deicing Technology - As per Tabulation (6/6/2016)

Scotwood Industries, Inc. - As per Tabulation (6/6/2016)

CARD NO 07-01




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT ONE LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 2 of 30 Pages
Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 1 Headquarters
P.O. Box 278
Wynne, Arkansas 72396

Central Salt, LLC
1420 State Road 14
Lyons, KS 67554
Lori Young 620-257-5626 Ext. 505
Fax 620-257-5052

Mid-American Salt, LLC.
4528 Hillegas Road
Fort Wayne, IN 46818
Michael Recker 260-387-6170
Fax 260-387-6056

Phone - (870) 238-8144 il
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu'Jm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu'Jm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized|  Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged [**Palletized| Bulk [**Palletized| Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS 22
LOCATIONS COUNTY
11 District Headquarters Cross
Hwy. 64 West, Wynne 72396 545.00
12 Area Headquarters Cross
Hwy. 284, Wynne 72396
Sub Headquarters
1-3 [Hwy. 77, Approx. 1 mi. S. of Gilmore Crittenden
Gilmore, AR 72339
14 Area Headqua}rters Crittenden
Hwy. 70, Lehi 72301
15 Area Headqua_rters Lee
Hwy. 79, Marianna 72396
16 Area Headql_Jarters Monroe
Hwy. 70, Brinkley 72021
1.7 Area Headquarters Phillips
Hwy. 49 (Walnut Corner) 72355
1.8 Area Headquarters_ St. Francis
Hwy. 70, Forrest City 72335
1.9 Area Headquarters Woodruff

Hwy. 64B, McCrory 72101

** Shrink Wrapped

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.
***NO BID




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT ONE LOCATIONS

Page 3 of 30 Pages

TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

Invoicing Information:
District 1 Headquarters
P.O. Box 278
Wynne, Arkansas 72396

Compass Minerals America Inc.
9900 West 109th Street
Overland Park, KS 66210
Monica Lloyd 800-323-1641
Fax 913-338-7945

Cargill, Inc. Deicing Technology Business
24950 Country Club Blvd. Suite #450
North Olmsted, OH 44070
Hannah Akers 800-600-7258
Fax 800-467-3409

Phone - (870) 238-8144 flaked
Calcium Pretreated-Rock-Salt- Calcium
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Rock Salt
Chloride ClearLane Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged [**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOAD
U ucC OADS 22.25
LOCATIONS COUNTY
11 District Headquarters Cross
Hwy. 64 West, Wynne 72396
12 Area Headquarters Cross
Hwy. 284, Wynne 72396 72.76
Sub Headquarters
1-3 [Hwy. 77, Approx. 1 mi. S. of Gilmore Crittenden
Gilmore, AR 72339 70.10
14 Area Headque}rters Crittenden
Hwy. 70, Lehi 72301 68.10
15 Area Headqua_rters Lee
Hwy. 79, Marianna 72396 74.55
16 Area Headql_Jarters Monroe
Hwy. 70, Brinkley 72021 77.82
1.7 Area Headquarters Phillips
Hwy. 49 (Walnut Corner) 72355 77.82
1.8 Area Headquarters_ St. Francis
Hwy. 70, Forrest City 72335 72.76
1.9 Area Headquarters Woodruff
Hwy. 64B, McCrory 72101 77.82

** Shrink Wrapped

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.

*** NO BID




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT TWO LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Openin

Page 4 of 30 Pages

g Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 2 Headquarters
P.O. Box 6836
Pine Bluff, Arkansas 71611
Phone - (870) 534-1612

Scotwood Industries Inc.
12980 Metcalf Ave. Suite 240
Overland Park, KS 66213
Allie Mahoney 913-851-3500
Fax 913-851-3377

Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114
Tony Frizzell/Luke Vance (800) 723-0309
Fax 501-945-6970

Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt CaIugm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calmgm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged [**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
25 22.5 22 23 22 23
LOCATIONS COUNTY
District Headquarters
2-1 |4900 Hwy. 65 South Jefferson
Pine Bluff 71611 208.20 488.00 215.00 121.00 200.00 92.00
Area Headquarters
2-2 1637 Hwy. 425 Jefferson
Pine Bluff 71611 208.20 121.00 92.00
Area Headquarters
2-3 |1-530 Exit 20 Hwy. 46 Jefferson
Redfield, AR 72132 208.20 121.00 92.00
Area Headquarters
2-4 |29 Pond Road (Hwy. 165) Arkansas
Stuttgart, AR 72164 208.20 124.00 92.00
Area Headquarters
2-5 |564 Hwy. 165 North Arkansas
Dewitt, AR 72042 208.20 129.00 96.00
Area Headquarters
2-6 |9054 Hwy. 65 North Desha
McGehee, AR 71654 208.20 131.00 100.00
Area Headquarters
2-7 (1225 Hwy. 270 East Grant
Sheridan, AR 72150 208.20 122.00 92.00

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.
** Shrink Wrapped




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT TWO LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 5 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 2 Headquarters
P.O. Box 6836
Pine Bluff, Arkansas 71611
Phone - (870) 534-1612

Central Salt, LLC
1420 State Road 14
Lyons, KS 67554
Lori Young 620-257-5626 Ext. 505
Fax 620-257-5052

*k*k

Mid-American Salt, LLC.
4528 Hillegas Road
Fort Wayne, IN 46818
Michael Recker 260-387-6170
Fax 260-387-6056

Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt

Calcium
Chloride

Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt

Calcium
Chloride

Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4

Item 5

Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4

Item 5

**Palletized
Per Ton

Bulk
Per Ton

**Palletized
Per Ton

Bulk
Per Ton

Bagged
Per Ton

**Palletized
Per Ton

Bulk
Per Ton

**Palletized
Per Ton

Bulk
Per Ton

Bagged
Per Ton

MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS

22

LOCATIONS COUNTY

District Headquarters
2-1 14900 Hwy. 65 South
Pine Bluff 71611

Jefferson

545.00

Area Headquarters
2-2 |637 Hwy. 425
Pine Bluff 71611

Jefferson

Area Headquarters
2-3 |1-530 Exit 20 Hwy. 46
Redfield, AR 72132

Jefferson

Area Headquarters
2-4 29 Pond Road (Hwy. 165)
Stuttgart, AR 72164

Arkansas

Area Headquarters
2-5 |564 Hwy. 165 North
Dewitt, AR 72042

Arkansas

Area Headquarters
2-6 19054 Hwy. 65 North
McGehee, AR 71654

Desha

Area Headquarters
2-7 11225 Hwy. 270 East
Sheridan, AR 72150

Grant

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.
** Shrink Wrapped *** NO BID




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT TWO LOCATIONS

Page 6 of 30 Pages

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

Invoicing Information:
District 2 Headquarters
P.O. Box 6836
Pine Bluff, Arkansas 71611

Compass Minerals America Inc.
9900 West 109th Street
Overland Park, KS 66210
Monica Lloyd 800-323-1641
Fax 913-338-7945

Cargill, Inc. Deicing Technology Business
24950 Country Club Blvd. Suite #450
North Olmsted, OH 44070
Hannah Akers 800-600-7258
Fax 800-467-3409

Phone - (870) 534-1612 Fhx
Calcium Pretreated-Rock-Sakt— Calcium
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Chloride ClearLane Rock Salt Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged [**Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
22-25
LOCATIONS COUNTY
District Headquarters
2-1 {4900 Hwy. 65 South Jefferson
Pine Bluff 71611 127.28
Area Headquarters
2-2 637 Hwy. 425 Jefferson
Pine Bluff 71611 121.28
Area Headquarters
2-3 |1-530 Exit 20 Hwy. 46 Jefferson
Redfield, AR 72132 127.28
Area Headquarters
2-4 129 Pond Road (Hwy. 165) Arkansas
Stuttgart, AR 72164 125.08
Area Headquarters
2-5 |564 Hwy. 165 North Arkansas
Dewitt, AR 72042 121.66
Area Headquarters
2-6 19054 Hwy. 65 North Desha
McGehee, AR 71654 128.96
Area Headquarters
2-7 (1225 Hwy. 270 East Grant
Sheridan, AR 72150 136.46

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.
** Shrink Wrapped *** NO BID




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT THREE LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 7 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 3 Headquarters
P.O. Box 490
Hope, Arkansas 71802
Phone - (870) 777-3457

Scotwood Industries Inc.
12980 Metcalf Ave. Suite 240
Overland Park, KS 66213
Allie Mahoney 913-851-3500
Fax 913-851-3377

Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114

Tony Frizzell/Luke Vance (800) 723-0309

Fax 501-945-6970

Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged [ **Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
25 22.5 22 23 22 23
LOCATIONS COUNTY
31 District Headquarters Hempstead
Hwy. 29, Hope 71802 185.40 | 488.00 215.00 134.00 200.00 102.00
3.2 Area Headquarters Hempstead
Hwy. 29 North, Hope 71802 488.00 215.00 200.00
33 Area Headquarters Howard
Hwy. 24, Nashville 71852 182.84 | 488.00 215.00 138.00 200.00 105.00
34 Area Headquarters Lafayette
Hwy. 29, Lewisville 71845 488.00 215.00 200.00
35 Area Headquarters Little River
Hwy. 71, Ashdown 71822 182.84 | 488.00 215.00 142.00 200.00 109.00
36 Area Headquarters Miller
Hwy. 237, Texarkana 71854 180.27 | 488.00 215.00 140.00 200.00 107.00
3.7 Area Headquarters Nevada
Hwy. 19, Prescott 71857 182.84 | 488.00 215.00 133.00 200.00 99.00
38 Area Headquarters Pike
Hwy. 27, Murfreesboro 71958 182.84 | 488.00 215.00 134.00 200.00 101.00
3.9 Area Headquarters Sevier
Hwy. 71, DeQueen 71832 488.00 215.00 200.00

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.

** Shrink Wrapped




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS
DISTRICT THREE LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 8 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 3 Headquarters
P.O. Box 490
Hope, Arkansas 71802

Central Salt, LLC
1420 State Road 14
Lyons, KS 67554

Lori Young 620-257-5626 Ext. 505

Fax 620-257-5052

Mid-American Salt, LLC.
4528 Hillegas Road
Fort Wayne, IN 46818
Michael Recker 260-387-6170
Fax 260-387-6056

Phone - (870) 777-3457 ok
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged [ **Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
22
LOCATIONS COUNTY
District Headquarters
31 lhwy. 29, Hope 71802 Hempstead 545.00
Area Headquarters
32 |Hwy. 29 North, Hope 71802 Hempstead 545.00
Area Headquarters
33 |Hwy. 24, Nashville 71852 Howard 545.00
Area Headquarters
34 |Hwy. 29, Lewisville 71845 Lafayette 545.00
Area Headquarters . .
35 lhwy. 71, Ashdown 71822 Little River 545.00
Area Headquarters .
36 lhwy. 237, Texarkana 71854 Miller 545.00
Area Headquarters
3T lhwy. 19, Prescott 71857 Nevada 545.00
Area Headquarters .
38 lhwy. 27, Murfreesboro 71958 Pike 545.00
3.9 Area Headquarters Sevier
Hwy. 71, DeQueen 71832 545.00

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.
*** NO BID

** Shrink Wrapped




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS
DISTRICT THREE LOCATIONS

Page 9 of 30 Pages

Invoicing Information:
District 3 Headquarters
P.O. Box 490
Hope, Arkansas 71802

Compass Minerals America Inc.

9900 West 109th Street
Overland Park, KS 66210
Monica Lloyd 800-323-1641

Fax 913-338-7945

Cargill, Inc. Deicing Technology Business

24950 Country Club Blvd. Suite #450

North Olmsted, OH 44070
Hannah Akers 800-600-7258
Fax 800-467-3409

Phone - (870) 777-3457 Fkx
Calcium | Pretreated-Rock-Sakl— Calcium
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Rock Salt
Chloride ClearLane Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized | Bulk [**Palletized| Bulk Bagged [|**Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | PerTon | Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
22-25
LOCATIONS COUNTY
3.1 District Headquarters Hempstead
Hwy. 29, Hope 71802 147.97
Area Headquarters
3-2 Hwy. 29 North, Hope 71802 Hempstead
33 Area Headquartgrs Howard
Hwy. 24, Nashville 71852 144.41
34 Area Headqua.rters Lafayette
Hwy. 29, Lewisville 71845
35 Area Headquarters Little River
Hwy. 71, Ashdown 71822 146.01
36 Area Headquarters Miller
Hwy. 237, Texarkana 71854 147.97
3.7 Area Headquarters Nevada
Hwy. 19, Prescott 71857 148.21
38 Area Headquarters Pike
Hwy. 27, Murfreeshoro 71958 142.59
3.9 Area Headquarters Sevier
Hwy. 71, DeQueen 71832

** Shrink Wrapped

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.

***NO BID




DISTRICT FOUR LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

Page 10 of 30 Pages
Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 4 Headquarters
P.O. Box 11170
Fort Smith, Arkansas 72917-1170
Phone - (479) 484-5306

Scotwood Industries Inc.
12980 Metcalf Ave. Suite 240
Overland Park, KS 66213
Allie Mahoney 913-851-3500
Fax 913-851-3377

Tony Frizzell/Luke Vance (800) 723-0309

Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114

Fax 501-945-6970

Calcium Calcium
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Chioride Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Chioride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk  [**Palletized Bulk Bagged [**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS 25 22.5 22 23 22 23
LOCATIONS COUNTY
41 District Headquarters Sebastian
808 Frontier Road, Barling 72923 488.00 215.00 200.00
4-2 Area Headquarters Sebastian
808 Frontier Road, Barling 72923 194.52 488.00 126.00 91.00
43 Sub Headquarters, 1-540 Exit 9 Sebastian
N.W. Infield, Fort Smith 72917 194.14 488.00 125.00 85.00
4 Area Headquarters Sebastian
Hwy. 10, Greenwood 72936 196.80 488.00 128.00 91.00
Area Headquarters
45 lhwy. 64, Alma 72956 Crawford 195.85 | 488.00 123.00 91.00
Area Headquarters
4-6 " 110435 Dollard Rd., Mountainburg 72946 Crawford 197.94 | 488.00 125.00 93.00
Area Headquarters .
4T |Hwy. 23, Ozark 72949 Franklin 22587 | 488.00 120.00 93.00
48 Area Headquarters Looan
Hwy. 22, Paris 72855 9 204.02 488.00 117.00 93.00
4-9 Area Headquarters Polk
Hwy. 71, Mena 72953 193.38 488.00 130.00 98.00
Area Headquarters
410 11wy, 718, Waldron 72958 Scott 196.80 | 488.00 123.00 93.00
Area Headquarters .
411 lhwy. 62, Lincoln 72744 Washington 199.65 | 488.00 134.00 95.00
Area Headquarters .
412y, 112, Fayetteville 72704 Washington 21238 | 488.00 131.00 93.00
Area Headquarters .
413 11wy, 71, West Fork 72774 Washington 20250 | 488.00 129.00 93.00
Sub Headquarters, Hwy. 74, .
41410 3 miles East of I-540, Winslow 72959 Washington 201.55 | 488.00 127.00 93.00
Sub Headquarters, Awy. 412,
4-15 |7.9 miles E. Hwy. 265 on 412 Washington
Nob Hill 72765 200.95 488.00 133.00 93.00
Sub Headquarters, 1-40 Exit 24
4-16 1N W. Corner, Mulberry 72947 Crawford 197.94 | 488.00 123.00 91.00

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.

** Shrink Wrapped




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS
DISTRICT FOUR LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 11 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 4 Headquarters
P.O. Box 11170
Fort Smith, Arkansas 72917-1170
Phone - (501) 646-5501

Central Salt, LLC
1420 State Road 14
Lyons, KS 67554

Lori Young 620-257-5626 Ext. 505

Fax 620-257-5052

Mid-American Salt, LLC.
4528 Hillegas Road
Fort Wayne, IN 46818
Michael Recker 260-387-6170
Fax 260-387-6056

Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcium ¥ protreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcium
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized| Bulk [**Palletized| Bulk Bagged [**Palletized Bulk  [**Palletized| Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS 24 22
LOCATIONS COUNTY
41 District Headquarters Sebasti
i 808 Frontier Road, Barling 72923 ebastian 545.00
Area Headquarters .
42 |308 Frontier Road, Barling 72923 Sebastian 95.40 545.00
43 Sub Headquarters, 1-540 Exit 9 Sebasi
™ |N.W. Infield, Fort Smith 72917 ehastian 98.62 545.00
4a Area Headquarters Sebasti
“* |Hwy. 10, Greenwood 72936 ebastian 98.62 545.00
Area Headquarters
45 |Hwy. 64, Alma 72956 Crawford 98.22 545.00
Area Headquarters
46 110435 Dollard Rd., Mountainburg 72946 Crawford 98.22 545.00
47 Area Headquarters Frankli
" |Hwy. 23, Ozark 72949 rankiin 99.28 545.00
Area Headquarters
48 |y, 22, paris 72855 Logan 109.74 545.00
Area Headquarters
49 [Hwy. 71, Mena 72953 Polk 109.27 545.00
Area Headquarters
410 |\ iwy. 71B, Waldron 72958 Scott 109.47 545.00
Area Headquarters .
411 lhwy. 62, Lincoln 72744 Washington 99.52 545.00
Area Headquarters .
412wy, 112, Fayetteville 72704 Washington 97.47 545.00
) Area Headquarters .
413 |y, 71, West Fork 72774 Washington 545.00
Sub Headquarters, Hwy. 74, .
41410 3 miles East of I-540, Winslow 72959 Washington 545.00
Sub Headquarters, Hwy. 412,
4-15 7.9 miles E. Hwy. 265 on 412 Washington
Nob Hill 72765 545.00
Sub Headquarters, 1-40 Exit 24
416 Inw. Corner, Mulberry 72947 Crawford 545.00

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.

** Shrink Wrapped




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT FOUR LOCATIONS

Page 12 of 30 Pages

TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

Invoicing Information:
District 4 Headquarters
P.O. Box 11170
Fort Smith, Arkansas 72917-1170

Compass Minerals America Inc.
9900 West 109th Street
Overland Park, KS 66210
Monica Lloyd 800-323-1641
Fax 913-338-7945

Cargill, Inc. Deicing Technology Business
24950 Country Club Blvd. Suite #450
North Olmsted, OH 44070
Hannah Akers 800-600-7258
Fax 800-467-3409

Phone - (501) 646-5501 folaed
Calcram Pretreated Rock Sal_ Calcium
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Chloride ClearLane Rock Salt Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk  [**Palletized Bulk bagged f**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton Per Ton [ PerTon Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | PerTon
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS 22-25
LOCATIONS COUNTY
District Headquarters .
41 808 Frontier Road, Barling 72923 Sebastian
Area Headquarters .
42 |08 Frontier Road, Barling 72923 Sebastian 74.04
4-3 Sub Headquarters, 1-540 Exit 9 Sebastian
N.W. Infield, Fort Smith 72917 74.04
Area Headquarters .
44 |Hwy. 10, Greenwood 72936 Sebastian 74.89
Area Headquarters
45 lhwy. 64, Alma 72956 Crawford 74.04
Area Headquarters
46 110435 Dollard Rd., Mountainburg 72946 Crawford 74.77
Area Headquarters .
4T lhwy. 23, Ozark 72949 Franklin 75.62
Area Headquarters
48 |y, 22, Paris 72855 Logan 77.28
) Area Headquarters
49|y, 71, Mena 72953 Polk 83.73
Area Headquarters
4-10 iy, 718, Waldron 72958 Seott 78.29
Area Headquarters .
411wy, 62, Lincoln 72744 Washington 78.29
Area Headquarters .
412wy, 112, Fayetteville 72704 Washington 78.29
Area Headquarters .
413 |lwy. 71, West Fork 72774 Washington 77.28
Sub Headquarters, Hwy. 74, .
414" 10 3 miles East of I-540, Winslow 72959 Washington 75.62
Sub Headquarters, Hwy. 412, .
4-1 Washingt
% |7.9 miles E. Hwy. 265 on 412, Nob Hill ashington 79.63
Sub Headquarters, 1-40 Exit 24
416 |N.W. Corner, Mulberry 72947 Crawford 7477
DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS. ** Shrink Wrapped *** NO BID




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT FIVE LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 13 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 5 Headquarters
P.O. Box 2376
Batesville, Arkansas 72503
Phone - (870) 251-2374

Scotwood Industries Inc.
12980 Metcalf Ave. Suite 240
Overland Park, KS 66213
Allie Mahoney 913-851-3500
Fax 913-851-3377

Oakley IEertiIizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114
Tony Frizzell/Luke Vance (800) 723-0309
Fax 501-945-6970

Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk  [**Palletized Bulk Bagged J**Palletized Bulk [**Palletized| Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton | Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
25 22.5 23 23
LOCATIONS COUNTY
5.1 District Headquarters Independence
Hwy. 167, Batesville 73501 223.78 488.00 121.00 98.00
5.9 Area Headquarters Cleburne
Hwy. 110, Heber Springs 72543 218.08 117.00 93.00
5.3 Area Headquarters Fulton
Hwy. 9, Salem 72576 234.23 121.00 108.00
5. Area Headquarters 1zard
Hwy. 69, Melbourne 72556 229.48 121.00 103.00
5.5 Area Headquarters Jackson
Andy Doyle Rd., Newport 72043 223.02 120.00 97.00
5.6 Area Headquarters Sharp
Hwy. 62, Highland/Hardy 72543 232.90 120.00 106.00
5.7 Area Headquarters Stone
Hwy. 9, Mt. View 72560 224.54 120.00 99.00
Area Headquarters -
58 |y, 258, Bald Knob 72010 White 217.70 120.00 93.00
Area Headquarters -
59 |Hwy. 367, Searcy 72143 White 21542 120.00 93.00

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.
** Shrink Wrapped




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS
DISTRICT FIVE LOCATIONS
Page 14 of 30 Pages

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017 Opening Date: May 17, 2016
Central Salt, LLC Mid-American Salt, LLC.
Invoicing Information: 1420 State Road 14 4528 Hillegas Road
District 5 Headquarters Lyons, KS 67554 Fort Wayne, IN 46818
P.O. Box 2376 Lori Young 620-257-5626 Ext. 505 Michael Recker 260-387-6170
Batesville, Arkansas 72503 Fax 620-257-5052 Fax 260-387-6056
Phone - (870) 251-2374
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5

**Palletized Bulk  [**Palletized| Bulk Bagged [**Palletized Bulk  [**Palletized| Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton | Per Ton

MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS

24 22
LOCATIONS COUNTY

District Headquarters
51 1wy, 167, Batesville 73501 Independence 545.00
5.0 Area Headquarters . Cleburne

Hwy. 110, Heber Springs 72543 109.24
5.3 Area Headquarters Eulton

Hwy. 9, Salem 72576 108.56
5.4 Area Headquarters 1zard

Hwy. 69, Melbourne 72556 109.42
5.5 Area Headquarters Jackson

Andy Doyle Rd., Newport 72043
5.6 Area Headq.uarters Sharp

Hwy. 62, Highland/Hardy 72543
5.7 Area Headquarters Stone

Hwy. 9, Mt. View 72560 107.56

Area Headquarters

White
Hwy. 258, Bald Knob 72010

Area Headquarters
Hwy. 367, Searcy 72143

White

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.
** Shrink Wrapped



ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT FIVE LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 15 of 30 Pages
Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Compass Minerals America Inc. Cargill, Inc. Deicing Technology Business
Invoicing Information: 9900 West 109th Street 24950 Country Club Blvd. Suite #450
District 5 Headquarters Overland Park, KS 66210 North Olmsted, OH 44070
P.O. Box 2376 Monica Lloyd 800-323-1641 Hannah Akers 800-600-7258
Batesville, Arkansas 72503 Fax 913-338-7945 Fax 800-467-3409
Phone - (870) 251-2374 il
Calcium Pretreated-Rock-Salt- Calcium
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Rock Salt
Chloride ClearLane Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged [**Palletized Bulk **Palletized| Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton
1 nn
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
22-25 22 22
LOCATIONS COUNTY
District Headquarters
1 1Hwy. 167, Batesville 73501 Independence 12100 114.61 104.61
5.2 Area Headquarters _ Clebumne
Hwy. 110, Heber Springs 72543 125.08 120.00 110.00
5.3 Area Headquarters Eulton
Hwy. 9, Salem 72576 128.96 111.65 101.65
5.4 Area Headquarters \zard
Hwy. 69, Melbourne 72556 127.04 116.77 106.77
5.5 Area Headquarters Jackson
Andy Doyle Rd., Newport 72043 118.54 113.81 103.81
5.6 Area Headq_uarters Sharp
Hwy. 62, Highland/Hardy 72543 127.28 111.11 101.11
5.7 Area Headquafters Stone
Hwy. 9, Mt. View 72560 127.04 118.92 108.92
5.8 Area Headquarters White
Hwy. 258, Bald Knob 72010 118.54 118.11 108.11
5.9 Area Headquarters White
Hwy. 367, Searcy 72143 120.88 119.46 109.46

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.
** Shrink Wrapped *** NO BID

1 Maximum of 10,000 Tons of White Salt & 5,000 Tons of Treated Salt per contract period.




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT SIX LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 16 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 6 Headquarters
P.O. Box 190296
Little Rock, Arkansas 72219

Scotwood Industries Inc.
12980 Metcalf Ave. Suite 240
Overland Park, KS 66213
Allie Mahoney 913-851-3500
Fax 913-851-3377

Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114
Tony Frizzell/Luke Vance (800) 723-0309
Fax 501-945-6970

Phone - (501) 569-2266 Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged [**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS 25 925 23 23
LOCATIONS COUNTY
District Headquarters
6-1 |8900 Mabelvale Pike Pulaski
Little Rock 72209 204.40 488.00 115.00 90.00
Area Headquarters
6-2 |801 Eureka Garden Road Pulaski
North Little Rock 72117 207.63 115.00 90.00
Area Headquarters
6-3 |401 Shamburger Lane Pulaski
Little Rock 72206 206.30 115.00 90.00
Area Headquarters
6-4 19001 Mabelvale Pike Pulaski
Little Rock 72209 204.40 115.00 90.00
Area Headquarters
6-5 |3600 Albert Pike Rd. Garland
Albert Pike, Hot Springs 71913 200.60 122.00 93.00
Area Headquarters
6-6 |3299 Oliver Lancaster Blvd. Hot Spring
Malvern 72104 198.70 122.00 91.00
Area Headquarters
67 |Hwy. 31, Lonoke 72086 Lonoke 211.05 120.00 91.00
6-8 Area Headquarters Prairie
Hwy. 70, Hazen 72064 214.09 122.00 92.00
6-9 Area Headquarters saline
Hwy. 67, Benton 72015 201.55 118.00 91.00
Temporary Area #1 .
6-101 | terchange 1-430/Hwy 10 72223 Pulaski 205.54 115.00 90.00
Temporary Area #2 .
6-11 Morggnll-)ﬁl?)o 72113 Pulaski 205.54 115.00 91.00

** Shrink Wrapped

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT SIX LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 17 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 6 Headquarters
P.O. Box 190296
Little Rock, Arkansas 72219

Phone - (501) 569-2266

Central Salt, LLC
1420 State Road 14
Lyons, KS 67554
Lori Young 620-257-5626 Ext. 505
Fax 620-257-5052

*k*x

Mid-American Salt, LLC.
4528 Hillegas Road
Fort Wayne, IN 46818
Michael Recker 260-387-6170
Fax 260-387-6056

Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt

Calcium
Chloride

Pretreated Rock Salt

Rock Salt

Calcium
Chloride

Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4

Item 5

Item 1

Item 2 Item 3 Item 4

Item 5

Bulk
Per Ton

**Palletized
Per Ton

Bulk
Per Ton

**Palletized
Per Ton

Bagged
Per Ton

**Palletized
Per Ton

Bulk
Per Ton

**Palletized
Per Ton

Bulk
Per Ton

Bagged
Per Ton

MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS

22

LOCATIONS

COUNTY

District Headquarters
6-1 8900 Mabelvale Pike
Little Rock 72209

Pulaski

545.00

Area Headquarters
6-2 |801 Eureka Garden Road
North Little Rock 72117

Pulaski

Area Headquarters
6-3 [401 Shamburger Lane
Little Rock 72206

Pulaski

Area Headquarters
6-4 (9001 Mabelvale Pike
Little Rock 72209

Pulaski

Area Headquarters
6-5 |3600 Albert Pike Rd.
Hot Springs 71913

Garland

Area Headquarters
6-6 |3299 Oliveer Lancaster Blvd.
Malvern 72104

Hot Spring

Area Headquarters

6-7
Hwy. 31, Lonoke 72086

Lonoke

Area Headquarters

6-8
Hwy. 70, Hazen 72064

Prairie

Area Headquarters

6-9
Hwy. 67, Benton 72015

Saline

Temporary Area #1

6-10
Interchange 1-430/Hwy 10 72223

Pulaski

Temporary Area #2

6-11 Morgan/1-430 /2113

Pulaski

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.

** Shrink Wrapped *** NO BID




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT SIX LOCATIONS

Page 18 of 30 Pages

TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

Invoicing Information:
District 6 Headquarters
P.O. Box 190296
Little Rock, Arkansas 72219

Compass Minerals America Inc.
9900 West 109th Street
Overland Park, KS 66210
Monica Lloyd 800-323-1641
Fax 913-338-7945

Cargill, Inc. Deicing Technology Business
24950 Country Club Blvd. Suite #450
North Olmsted, OH 44070
Hannah Akers 800-600-7258
Fax 800-467-3409

*k*
Phone - (501) 569-2266 Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt gﬁ:g'rl:g; ClearLane Rock Salt gﬁ:g'rl:g;
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged J**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS 29 25
LOCATIONS COUNTY
District Headquarters
6-1 8900 Mabelvale Pike Pulaski
Little Rock 72209 125.08
Area Headquarters
6-2 |801 Eureka Garden Road Pulaski
North Little Rock 72117 123.48
Area Headquarters
6-3 |401 Shamburger Lane Pulaski
Little Rock 72206 125.08
Area Headquarters
6-4 19001 Mabelvale Pike Pulaski
Little Rock 72209 127.28
Area Headquarters
6-5 |3600 Albert Pike Rd. Garland
Hot Springs 71913 130.06
Area Headquarters
6-6 [3299 Oliveer Lancaster Blvd. Hot Spring
Malvern 72104 132.66
Area Headquarters
67 |riwy. 31, Lonoke 72086 Lonoke 121.66
Area Headquarters .
%8 |\ iwy. 70, Hazen 72064 Pririe 118.54
6:9 Area Headquarters saline
Hwy. 67, Benton 72015 127.04
6-10 Temporary Area #1 Pulaski
Interchange 1-430/Hwy 10 72223 125.08
6-11 Temporary Area #2 Pulaski
Morgan/I-430 72113 127.28
DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.  ** Shrink Wrapped *** NO BID




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT SEVEN LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Page 19 of 30 Pages

Invoicing Information:
District 7 Headquarters
P.O. Box 897
Camden, Arkansas 71711
Phone - (870) 836-6401

Scotwood Industries Inc.
12980 Metcalf Ave. Suite 240
Overland Park, KS 66213
Allie Mahoney 913-851-3500
Fax 913-851-3377

Tony Frizzell/Luke Vance (800) 723-0309

Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114

Fax 501-945-6970

Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt CaIugm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu.Jm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized| Bulk [**Palletized| Bulk Bagged [§**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
25 22.5 22 23 22 23
LOCATIONS COUNTY
7.1 District Headquarters Ouachita
2245 California Ave., Camden 71701 194.71 | 488.00 215.00 133.00 200.00 99.00
Area Headquarters
7-2 1483 W. Reynolds Rd. Clark
Arkadelphia 71923 193.95 | 488.00 215.00 126.00 200.00 95.00
7.3 Area Headquarters Calhoun
Hwy. 167, Hampton 71744 488.00 220.00 225.00
Thornton Salt Facility
7-4 |Intersection of Hwy 79/Hwy 167 Calhoun
Thornton, AR 71766 197.97 130.00 98.00
Area Headquarters
75 1wy, 79, Rison 71665 Cleveland 488.00 | 215.00 200.00
7.6 Area Headquarters Columbia
211 Taylor Hwy., Magnolia 71753 488.00 215.00 200.00
7.7 Area Headquarters Dallas
Hwy. 8, Fordyce 71742 488.00 215.00 200.00
Area Headquarters .
78 |\iwy. 278, Camden 71701 Ouachita 488.00 | 215.00 200.00
7.9 Area Headquarters Union
Hwy. 167, El Dorado 71730 488.00 215.00 200.00
Area Headquarters
710388 Hwy. 278 W, Warren 71671 Bradley 488.00 | 215.00 200.00

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.

** Shrink Wrapped




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT SEVEN LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 20 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 7 Headquarters
P.O. Box 897
Camden, Arkansas 71711

Central Salt, LLC
1420 State Road 14
Lyons, KS 67554
Lori Young 620-257-5626 Ext. 505
Fax 620-257-5052

Mid-American Salt, LLC.
4528 Hillegas Road
Fort Wayne, IN 46818
Michael Recker 260-387-6170
Fax 260-387-6056

Phone - (870) 836-6401 ol
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged [**Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged
Per Ton | PerTon | PerTon | PerTon | Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
22
LOCATIONS COUNTY
71 District I—.|eadq.uarters Ouachita
2245 California Ave., Camden 71701 545.00
Area Headquarters
7-2 1483 W. Reynolds Rd. Clark
Arkadelphia 71923 545.00
7.3 Area Headquarters Calhoun
Hwy. 167, Hampton 71744 545.00
Thornton Salt Facility
7-4 |Intersection of Hwy 79/Hwy 167 Calhoun
Thornton, AR 71766
7.5 Area Headquarters Cleveland
Hwy. 79, Rison 71665 545.00
7.6 Area Headquarters ' Columbia
211 Taylor Hwy., Magnolia 71753 545.00
7.7 Area Headquarters Dallas
Hwy. 8, Fordyce 71742 545.00
7.8 Area Headquarters Ouachita
Hwy. 278, Camden 71701 545.00
7.9 Area Headquarters Union
Hwy. 167, El Dorado 71730 545.00
710 Area Headquarters Bradley
388 Hwy. 278 W, Warren 71671 545.00
DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.  ** Shrink Wrapped *** NO BID




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT SEVEN LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 21 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 7 Headquarters
P.O. Box 897
Camden, Arkansas 71711

Compass Minerals America Inc.
9900 West 109th Street
Overland Park, KS 66210
Monica Lloyd 800-323-1641
Fax 913-338-7945

Cargill, Inc. Deicing Technology Business
24950 Country Club Blvd. Suite #450
North Olmsted, OH 44070
Hannah Akers 800-600-7258
Fax 800-467-3409

Phone - (870) 836-6401 Fkx
Calcium | Pretreated-Rock-Salt— Calcium
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Rock Salt
Chloride ClearLane Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged [**Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged
Per Ton | PerTon | PerTon | PerTon | Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
22-25
LOCATIONS COUNTY
71 District I—.|eadq.uarters Ouachita
2245 California Ave., Camden 71701 150.40
Area Headquarters
7-2 |483 W. Reynolds Rd. Clark
Arkadelphia 71923 la4.41
7.3 Area Headquarters Calhoun
Hwy. 167, Hampton 71744
Thornton Salt Facility
7-4 |Intersection of Hwy 79/Hwy 167 Calhoun
Thornton, AR 71766 153.09
7.5 Area Headquarters Cleveland
Hwy. 79, Rison 71665
7.6 Area Headquarters ' Columbia
211 Taylor Hwy., Magnolia 71753
7.7 Area Headquarters Dallas
Hwy. 8, Fordyce 71742
7.8 Area Headquarters Ouachita
Hwy. 278, Camden 71701
7.9 Area Headquarters Union
Hwy. 167, El Dorado 71730
710 Area Headquarters Bradley
388 Hwy. 278 W, Warren 71671
DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.  ** Shrink Wrapped *** NO BID




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT EIGHT LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 22 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 8 Headquarters
P.O. Box 70
Russellville, Arkansas 72811
Phone - (501) 968-2286

Scotwood Industries Inc.
12980 Metcalf Ave. Suite 240
Overland Park, KS 66213
Allie Mahoney 913-851-3500
Fax 913-851-3377

Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114
Tony Frizzell/Luke Vance (800) 723-0309
Fax 501-945-6970

Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt CaIugm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk  |**Palletized Bulk Bagged [ **Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
25 22.5 22 23 22 23
LOCATIONS COUNTY
8-1 District Headquarters Pope
Hwy. 7 & 1-40, Russellville 72801 209.15 488.00 215.00 115.00 200.00 94.00
8-2 Area Headquarters Pope
Hob Nob Rd., Exit 84, Russellville 72801 209.15 115.00 94.00
8-3 Area Headquarters Conway
Hwy. 64 West, Morrilton 72110 214.47 110.00 93.00
8-4 Area Headquarters Faulkner
Hwy. 64 East, Conway 72032 210.48 115.00 90.00
85 Area Headquarters Johnson
Hwy. 64 West, Clarksville 72830 204.02 118.00 93.00
8-6 Area Headquarters Montgomery
Hwy. 270, Pencil Bluff 71965 198.70 122.00 99.00
87 Area Headquarters Perry
Hwy. 60, Perryville 72126 209.15 115.00 93.00
Area Headquarters
88 |Lwy. 95, Clinton 72031 Van Buren 217.70 115.00 94.00
8-9 Area Headquarters vell
Hwy. 27, Danville 72833 206.30 124.00 90.00
Twin Groves Salt Facility
8-10]11wy. 65 South of Damascus 72039 Faulkner 208.79 115.00 93.00
Botkinburg Salt Facility
8-11|1 mi N of Botkinburg North Van Buren
Intersection with Hwy 65 & 110 72031 208.79 115.00 95.00
Onyx Salt Facility
8-12(28118 S. State Hwy. 27 Yell
Plainview 72857 208.79 118.00 96.00
8-13 Fourche Jct. Salt Facility Perry
Ject. Hwy. 60/Hwy. 7 72126 209.15 118.00 99.00
8-14 Pelsor Salt Facility (1 Mi. S. of Pelsor) Pope
37485 State Road 7, Dover 72837 209.15 125.00 105.00

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.

** Shrink Wrapped




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT EIGHT LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 23 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 8 Headquarters
P.O. Box 70
Russellville, Arkansas 72811
Phone - (501) 968-2286

Central Salt, LLC
1420 State Road 14
Lyons, KS 67554
Lori Young 620-257-5626 Ext. 505
Fax 620-257-5052

Mid-American Salt, LLC.
4528 Hillegas Road
Fort Wayne, IN 46818
Michael Recker
Fax 260-387-6056

Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt CaIC“.Jm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt CaIC“.Jm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk |**Palletized Bulk Bagged [ **Palletized Bulk | **Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS 24 22
LOCATIONS COUNTY
8-1 District Headquarters _ Pope
Hwy. 7 & 1-40, Russellville 72801 106.67 545.00
Area Headquarters
82 | iob Nob Rd., Exit 84, Russellville 72801~ "°P¢ 1Uo.6/
5 |Area Headquarters
83 |y, 64 West, Morrilton 72110 Conway 108.32
_4 |Area Headquarters
84 |\ iwy. 64 East, Conway 72032 Faulkner
= |Area Headquarters
85 |riwy. 64 West, Clarksville 72830 Johnson 104.23
8-6 Area Headquartiars Montgomery
Hwy. 270, Pencil Bluff 71965 110.54
87 Area Headquarte.rs Perry
Hwy. 60, Perryville 72126
8.8 Area Heaqu.Jarters Van Buren
Hwy. 95, Clinton 72031 108.57
8-9 Area Headquar?ers vell
Hwy. 27, Danville 72833 110.25
Twin Groves Salt Facility
8-10 Hwy. 65 South of Damascus 72039 Faulkner
Botkinburg Salt Facility
8-11{1 mi N of Botkinburg North Van Buren
Intersection with Hwy. 65 & 110 72031 108.57
Onyx Salt Facility
8-12128118 S. State Hwy. 27 Yell
Plainview 72857
8-13 Fourche Jct. Salt Facility Perry
Jct. Hwy. 60/Hwy. 7 72126
8-14 Pelsor Salt Facility (1 Mi. S. of Pelsor) Pope
37485 State Road 7, Dover 72837 106.67

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.

** Shrink Wrapped




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT EIGHT LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 24 of 30 Pages
Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Compass Minerals America Inc. Cargill, Inc. Deicing Technology Business
Invoicing Information: 9900 West 109th Street 24950 Country Club Blvd. Suite #450
District 8 Headquarters Overland Park, KS 66210 North Olmsted, OH 44070
P.0. Box 70 Monica Lloyd 800-323-1641 Hannah Akers 800-600-7258
Russellville, Arkansas 72811 Fax 913-338-7945 Fax 800-467-3409
Phone - (501) 968-2286 ookl
Calcium Rretreated-Rock-Sah— Calcium
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Rock Salt
Chloride ClearLane Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized| Bulk [**Palletized| Bulk Bagged J**Palletized| Bulk [**Palletized| Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS 22-25
LOCATIONS COUNTY
8.1 District Headquarters Pope
Hwy. 7 & I-40, Russellville 72801 P 86.69
Area Headquarters
8-2 | 1ob Nob Rd., Exit 84, Russellville 72801] ~ PoPe 50.0Y
83 Area Headquarters _ Conway
Hwy. 64 West, Morrilton 72110 91.75
Area Headquarters
8-4 Faulki
Hwy. 64 East, Conway 72032 autkner 94.48
= |Area Headquarters
85 | 1wy, 64 West, Clarksville 72830 Johnson 83.04
_« |Area Headquarters
86 |y, 270, Pencil Bluff 71965 Montgomery 88.48
- |Area Headquarters
87 |Hwy. 60, Perryville 72126 Perry 92.95
_a |Area Headquarters
88 |\iwy. 95, Clinton 72031 Van Buren 96.82
o |Area Headquarters
89 |riwy. 27, Danville 72833 vell 86.40
Twin Groves Salt Facility
-10 Faulki
810140y 65 South of Damascus 72039 autner 96.82
Botkinburg Salt Facility
8-111 mi N of Botkinburg North Van Buren
Intersection with Hwy. 65 & 110 72031 96.82
Onyx Salt Facility
8-12(28118 S. State Hwy. 27 Yell
Plainview 72857 88.48
8-13 Fourche Jct. Salt Facility Perry
Jet. Hwy. 60/Hwy. 7 72126 92.95
Pelsor Salt Facility (1 Mi. S. of Pelsor)
814137485 State Road 7, Dover 72837 Pope 87.23
DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS. ** Shrink Wrapped *** NO BID




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

Date of Contract: Jul

DISTRICT NINE LOCATIONS

y 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 25 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 9 Headquarters
P.O. Box 610
Harrison, Arkansas 72602
Phone - (870) 743-2100

Scotwood Industries Inc.
12980 Metcalf Ave. Suite 240
Overland Park, KS 66213
Allie Mahoney 913-851-3500
Fax 913-851-3377

Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114
Tony Frizzell/Luke Vance (800) 723-0309
Fax 501-945-6970

Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt CaImgm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged [**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
25 22.5 22 23 23
LOCATIONS COUNTY
91 District Headquarters Boone
Hwy. 65, Harrison 72601 213.90 488.00 215.00 125.00 104.00
92 Area Headquarters Boone
Airport Rd., Harrison 72601 213.90 488.00 215.00 125.00 104.00
9.3 Area Headquarters Baxter
3423 Hwy. 5 South., Mt. Home 72653 222.64 488.00 215.00 126.00 105.00
9.4 Area Headquarters Benton
Ject. Hwy. 62 & 72, Garfield 72732 204.78 488.00 215.00 138.00 97.00
9.5 Area Headquarters Benton
Hwy. 59, Gentry 72734 196.99 488.00 215.00 136.00 97.00
9.6 Area Headquarters carroll
Hwy. 62, Berryville 72616 210.48 488.00 215.00 131.00 103.00
9.7 Area Headquarters Madison
Hwy. 412, Huntsville 72740 205.35 488.00 215.00 136.00 98.00
9.8 Area Headquarters Marion
Hwy. 62, Yellville 72687 218.84 488.00 215.00 125.00 102.00
Area Headquarters
99 |\ iwy. 74, Jasper 72641 Newton 21390 | 48800 | 21500 | 127.00 108.00
9-10 Area Headquarters Searcy
Hwy. 27, Marshall 72650 222.83 488.00 215.00 118.00 98.00
Area Headquarters
9-11(1-540, Exit 83, SH 94 @ Benton
Champion Dr., Rogers 72756 201.74 | 488.00 215.00 135.00 97.00

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.
** Shrink Wrapped




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

Date of Contract: Jul

DISTRICT NINE LOCATIONS

y 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 26 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 9 Headquarters
P.O. Box 610
Harrison, Arkansas 72602
Phone - (870) 743-2100

Central Salt, LLC
1420 State Road 14
Lyons, KS 67554
Lori Young 620-257-5626 Ext. 505
Fax 620-257-5052

Mid-American Salt, LLC.
4528 Hillegas Road
Fort Wayne, IN 46818
Michael Recker 260-387-6170
Fax 260-387-6056

Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Ca'c“ﬂm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged J**Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
24 22
LOCATIONS COUNTY
_, |District Headquarters
%1\ iwy. 65, Harrison 72601 Boone 97.08 545.00
_, |Area Headquarters
92 Airport Rd., Harrison 72601 Boone 99.11 545.00
_o |Area Headquarters
9-3 13423 Hwy. 5 South, Mt. Home 72653 Baxter 103.57 545.00
_, |Area Headquarters
94 | 1et. Hwy. 62 & 72, Garfield 72732 Benton 98.23 545.00
= |Area Headquarters
%5 1wy, 59, Gentry 72734 Benton 98.34 545.00
_~ |Area Headquarters
96 |Liwy. 62, Berryville 72616 Carroll 102.13 545.00
- |Area Headquarters ;
7 |nwy. 412, Huntsville 72740 Madison 102.23 545,00
o |Area Headquarters ;
98 |hwy. 62, Yellville 72687 Marion 103.26 545.00
_g |Area Headquarters
99 |niwy. 74, Jasper 72641 Newton 102.19 545.00
_1n|Area Headquarters
9101 . 27, Marshall 72650 Searcy 105.23 545.00
Area Headquarters
9-1111-540, Exit 83, SH 94 @ Benton
Champion Dr., Rogers 72756 100.41 545.00

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.

** Shrink Wrapped




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

Date of Contract: Jul

DISTRICT NINE LOCATIONS

y 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 27 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 9 Headquarters
P.O. Box 610
Harrison, Arkansas 72602

Compass Minerals America Inc.
9900 West 109th Street
Overland Park, KS 66210
Monica Lloyd 800-323-1641
Fax 913-338-7945

Cargill, Inc. Deicing Technology Business
24950 Country Club Blvd. Suite #450
North Olmsted, OH 44070
Hannah Akers 800-600-7258
Fax 800-467-3409

Phone - (870) 743-2100 falaked
Calcium Pretreated-Rock-Salt- Calcium
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Rock Salt
Chloride ClearLane Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged |™**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
22-25
LOCATIONS COUNTY
91 District Headq_uarters Boone
Hwy. 65, Harrison 72601 94.48
92 A_rea Headquarter_s Boone
Airport Rd., Harrison 72601 94.48
93 Area Headquarters Baxter
3423 Hwy. 5 South, Mt. Home 72653 103.22
9.4 Area Headquarters _ Benton
Ject. Hwy. 62 & 72, Garfield 72732 87.23
9.5 Area Headquarters Benton
Hwy. 59, Gentry 72734 86.40
9.6 Area Headquarte_rs carroll
Hwy. 62, Berryville 72616 91.75
9.7 Area Headquarters_ Madison
Hwy. 412, Huntsville 72740 86.69
9.8 Area Headquart_ers Marion
Hwy. 62, Yellville 72687 99.42
9:9 Area Headquarters Newton
Hwy. 74, Jasper 72641 92.95
9-10 Area Headquarters Searcy
Hwy. 27, Marshall 72650 97.60
Area Headquarters
9-1111-540, Exit 83, SH 94 @ Benton
Champion Dr., Rogers 72756 86.40
DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.  ** Shrink Wrapped *** NO BID




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT TEN LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 28 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 10 Headquarters

P.O.

Box 98

Paragould, Arkansas 72451
Phone - (870) 239-9511

Scotwood Industries Inc.
12980 Metcalf Ave. Suite 240
Overland Park, KS 66213
Allie Mahoney 913-851-3500
Fax 913-851-3377

Oakley Fertilizer, Inc.
3700 East Lincoln Avenue
North Little Rock, AR 72114
Tony Frizzell/Luke Vance (800) 723-0309
Fax 501-945-6970

Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calmgm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calmgm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized Bulk |**Palletized Bulk Bagged [**Palletized Bulk **Palletized Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | PerTon Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
25 22.5 22 23 22 23
LOCATIONS COUNTY
10-1 District Headquarters Greene
Hwy. 412 W., Paragould 72450 488.00 215.00 205.00
10-2 Area Headquarters Greene
Monroe St., Paragould 72451 234.42 115.00 108.00
Area Headquarters
10-31 1wy, 67, Corning 72422 Clay 237.65 115.00 111.00
Area Headquarters .
10-411wy. 18 & 63, Joneshoro 72401 Craighead 231.00 116.00 103.00
105 Area Headquarters Lawrence
Hwy. 412, Walnut Ridge 72476 229.48 116.00 103.00
10-6 Area Headquarters Mississippi
Hwy. 18, Blytheville 72315 PP 240.88 112.00 115.00
10-7 Area Headquarters Mississippi
Hwy. 119, Osceola 72370 PP 238.60 114.00 112.00
Area Headquarters .
10-8 1wy 149, Marked Tree 72386 Poinsett 231.38 117.00 108.00
Area Headquarters
10-91 1wy, 115, Pocahontas 72455 Randolph 232.90 117.00 106.00
Hwy 67/Hwy 226 Interchange .
10-10},est of Cash, AR 72455 Craighead 234.54 117.00 104.00

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.

** Shrink Wrapped




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS

DISTRICT TEN LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 29 of 30 Pages

Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Invoicing Information:
District 10 Headquarters

Central Salt, LLC
1420 State Road 14
Lyons, KS 67554

Mid-American Salt, LLC.
4528 Hillegas Road
Fort Wayne, IN 46818

P.O. Box 98 Lori Young 620-257-5626 Ext. 505 Michael Recker 260-387-6170
Paragould, Arkansas 72451 Fax 620-257-5052 Fax 260-387-6056
Phone - (870) 239-9511 fleled
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Calcu_Jm
Chloride Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged [**Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
22
LOCATIONS COUNTY
10-1 District Headquarters Greene
Hwy. 412 W., Paragould 72450 545.00
Area Headquarters
10-2 [\ onroe St., Paragould 72451 Greene
10-3 Area Headquar.ters Clay
Hwy. 67, Corning 72422
10-4 Area Headquarters Craighead
Hwy. 18 & 63, Joneshoro 72401
10-5 Area Headquarters . Lawrence
Hwy. 412, Walnut Ridge 72476
10-6 Area Headquarter§ Mississippi
Hwy. 18, Blytheville 72315
10-7 Area Headquarters Mississippi
Hwy. 119, Osceola 72370
10-8 Area Headquarters Poinsett
Hwy. 149, Marked Tree 72386
10-9 Area Headquarters Randolph
Hwy. 115, Pocahontas 72455
10-10 Hwy 67/Hwy 226 Interchange Craighead
West of Cash, AR 72455
DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.  ** Shrink Wrapped **% NO BIL




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
TABULATION FOR SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-17-201J - SNOW AND ICE CONTROL MATERIALS
DISTRICT TEN LOCATIONS

Date of Contract: July 1, 2016 thru April 30, 2017

Page 30 of 30 Pages
Opening Date: May 17, 2016

Compass Minerals America Inc. Cargill, Inc. Deicing Technology Business
Invoicing Information: 9900 West 109th Street 24950 Country Club Blvd. Suite #450
District 10 Headquarters Overland Park, KS 66210 North Olmsted, OH 44070
P.O. Box 98 Monica Lloyd 800-323-1641 Hannah Akers 800-600-7258
Paragould, Arkansas 72451 Fax 913-338-7945 Fax 800-467-3409
Phone - (870) 239-9511 41
Calcium | PretreatedRock-Salt— Calcium
Pretreated Rock Salt Rock Salt Rock Salt
Chloride ClearLane Chloride
Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 4 Item 5
**Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged [**Palletized| Bulk |**Palletized| Bulk Bagged
Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton | Per Ton
nt n
MINIMUM TRUCK LOADS
22-25 22 22
LOCATIONS COUNTY
10-1 District Headquarters Greene
Hwy. 412 W., Paragould 72450
Area Headquarters
10-2 [\ onroe St., Paragould 72451 Greene 831/ 119.92 109.92
10-3 Area Headquar.ters Clay
Hwy. 67, Corning 72422 88.42 116.26 106.26
10-4 Area Headquarters Craighead
Hwy. 18 & 63, Joneshoro 72401 82.57 114.10 104.10
10-5 Area Headquarters . Lawrence
Hwy. 412, Walnut Ridge 72476 85.30 114.62 104.62
10-6 Area Headquarter§ Mississippi
Hwy. 18, Blytheville 72315 80.50 115.74 105.74
10-7 Area Headquarters Mississippi
Hwy. 119, Osceola 72370 78.05 118.95 108.95
10-8 Area Headquarters Poinsett
Hwy. 149, Marked Tree 72386 76.56 115.66 105.66
10-9 Area Headquarters Randolph
Hwy. 115, Pocahontas 72455 87.64 112.01 102.01
10-10 Hwy 67/Hwy 226 Interchange Craighead
West of Cash, AR 72455 87.64 116.27 106.27

** Shrink Wrapped

DENOTES LOW BIDDER MEETING SPECS.

I Maximum of 10,000 Tons of White Salt & 5,000 Tons of Treated Salt per contract period.
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