
DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

BID NO.:  M-17-041J DATE OPENED:  3/14/2017

               FOB:  PAGE:  1 of 2
DELIVERY:  Franklin & Sebastian Co.

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

96,245.60 206,892.80 38,005.50

96,245.60 58,189.50 38,005.50

 AWARDED BY:  Purchasing Committee DATE:  CARD: 05-04

AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  

ITEM(S):  

ITEM(S):  

Franklin Co., Hwy 219 21.65 38,450.40              

Jerry A. Arnold  PH:  918-825-3370

41,881.50              30.40 41,404.80              30.75

25.00

24.75                

4. 1,362

1. 923 Washington Co., Hwy 16

Scott Co., Hwy 270

No Bid

3.

Mineral Aggregate Class 2

DESCRIPTION

Apac-Central Inc.
1010 Frontier Road

Within 60 days from date of award

Ted Craft  PH:  479-788-6302
Barling, AR  72923

River Valley Quarries, LLC
P O Box 982

Jerry A. Arnold  PH:  918-825-3370

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
AHTD - TABULATION

(D-4) - Washington (2), Polk, Scott 

BIDDING:  

ALL OR NONE:  

Pryor, OK  74362

Benton County Stone Co., Inc.
P O Box 988
Pryor, OK  74362

No Bid

2. 1,949 Washington Co., Hwy 59 48,725.00              19.50No Bid

22,844.25              

38,628.00              

19,468.80              19.706.

1,035 Polk Co., Hwy 8

38,005.50              

5. 1,776

16,390.40              23.40832 Sebastian Co., Hwy 22

21.75

River Valley Quarries, LLC 4-6 Only

RECOMMENDED AWARD:

TOTAL:

3/28/2017

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid 34.15 35,345.25              

AWARDED TO:  

AWARDED TO:  

1 & 3 OnlyApac-Central, Inc.

Benton County Stone Co., Inc. 2 Only



DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017
BID NO.:  M-17-041J DATE OPENED:  3/14/2017

               FOB:  PAGE:  2 of 2
DELIVERY:  Franklin & Sebastian Co.

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

92,478.03

RECOMMENDED AWARD:

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
AHTD - TABULATION

Mineral Aggregate Class 2

(D-4) - Washington (2), Polk, Scott 
Within 60 days from date of award

Duffield Gravel Company
16 Bluff Drive
Russellville, AR  72802
Ronnie Duffield  PH:  479-967-5565

BIDDING:  
DESCRIPTION

1. 923 Washington Co., Hwy 16

ALL OR NONE:  

No Bid

2. 1,949 Washington Co., Hwy 59 No Bid

3. 1,035 Polk Co., Hwy 8 41.99 43,459.65              

4. 1,362 Scott Co., Hwy 270 35.99 49,018.38              

5. 1,776 Franklin Co., Hwy 219 No Bid

6. 832 Sebastian Co., Hwy 22 No Bid

TOTAL:


	Short Tab

