
Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DESCRIPTION:

CONTRACT NO.:  H-18-236H DATE OPENED: 2/13/2018

               FOB:  PAGE: 1 of 6

ITEM NO. QTY. PRICE MAKE MODEL DELIVERY

1. 7 27,432.00 RAM 2500 Crew Cab 12-14 Weeks

2. 12 27,432.00 RAM 2500 Crew Cab 12-14 Weeks

3. 1 24,519.00 RAM 2500 Crew Cab 12-14 Weeks

4. 1 27,603.00 RAM 2500 Crew Cab 12-14 Weeks

5. 1 35,658.00 RAM 2500 Crew Cab 12-14 Weeks

6. 1 35,658.00 RAM 2500 Crew Cab 12-14 Weeks

7. 1 24,474.00 RAM 2500 Crew Cab 12-14 Weeks

CARD: 00-25

TENTATIVE AWARD BY: DATE: 3/13/2018

ITEM(S): Items 2, 3, and  6

Breeden Dodge Chrysler Jeep (3/29/2018)

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD 389,361.00$                                

TOTAL:  

AWARDED TO:

669,120.00

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION

ARDOT TABULATION

Little Rock, AR

Breeden Dodge Chrysler Jeep Inc

Pickups 3/4 Ton

EXTENSION

35,658.00                                          

27,603.00                                          

24,519.00                                          

329,184.00                                        

192,024.00                                        

5900 Highway 715

Fort Smith, AR 72908

Dean Pendergrass 479-646-4731

dean@breedendodge.com

VENDOR:  

ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES

TBD

TBD

TBD

TBD

TBD

TBD

TBD24,474.00                                          

35,658.00                                          

Purchasing Committee

mailto:dean@breedendodge.com


Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DESCRIPTION:

CONTRACT NO.:  H-18-236H DATE OPENED: 2/13/2018

               FOB:  PAGE: 2 of 6

Superior Auto Group

ITEM NO. QTY. PRICE MAKE MODEL DELIVERY

1. 7 27,784.00 CHEVROLET CK25753 7/1/2018

2. 12 27,891.00 RAM DJ7L91 7/1/2018

3. 1 25,105.00 RAM DJ2L91 7/1/2018

4. 1 25,276.00 RAM DJ2L92 7/1/2018

5. 1 27,891.00 RAM DJ7L92 7/1/2018

6. 1 35,989.00 RAM DJ7L91 7/1/2018

7. 1 27,107.00 CHEVROLET CC25953 7/1/2018

CARD: 00-25

TENTATIVE AWARD BY: DATE:

ITEM(S):

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION

ARDOT TABULATION

Pickups 3/4 Ton

Little Rock, AR

ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES

7/1/2018

7/1/2018

7/1/2018

7/1/2018

VENDOR:  

490 Hwy 412 East

Siloam Springs, AR 72761

Don Clark 479-268-1003

dclark@superiornwa.com

EXTENSION

25,276.00                                          

25,105.00                                          

334,692.00                                        

194,488.00                                        

7/1/2018

7/1/2018

7/1/201827,107.00                                          

35,989.00                                          

27,891.00                                          

ALL OR NONE

AWARDED TO:

670,548.00TOTAL:  

mailto:dclark@superiornwa.com


Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DESCRIPTION:

CONTRACT NO.:  H-18-236H DATE OPENED: 2/13/2018

               FOB:  PAGE: 3 of 6

ITEM NO. QTY. PRICE MAKE MODEL DELIVERY

1* 7 27,788.00 FORD 2018 F250 90 to 120 Days

2. 12 29,261.00 FORD 2018 F250 90 to 120 Days

3. 1 26,507.00 FORD 2018 F250 90 to 120 Days

4. 1 26,804.00 FORD 2018 F250 90 to 120 Days

5. 1 29,440.00 FORD 2018 F250 90 to 120 Days

6. 1 37,015.00 FORD 2018 F250 90 to 120 Days

7. 1 25,173.00 FORD 2018 F250 90 to 120 Days

CARD: 00-25

TENTATIVE AWARD BY: DATE: 3/13/2018

ITEM(S):

Purchasing Committee

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD 219,689.00$                                

Mark McLarty FORD

gsmith@mclartyauto.com

194,516.00                                        

EXTENSION

10/30/2018

10/30/2018

10/30/2018

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION

ARDOT TABULATION

Pickups 3/4 Ton

Little Rock, AR

VENDOR:  

4400 Landers Road

North Little Rock, AR 72118

Jerry Smith 501-945-8213

ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES

10/30/2018

10/30/2018

26,804.00                                          

26,507.00                                          

351,132.00                                        

TOTAL:  

AWARDED TO:

690,587.00

10/30/2018

Items 1 and 7

Mark McLarty Ford (3/27/2018)

*Low Bid Meeting Specifications

25,173.00                                          

37,015.00                                          

29,440.00                                          

10/30/2018

mailto:gsmith@mclartyauto.com


Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DESCRIPTION:

CONTRACT NO.:  H-18-236H DATE OPENED: 2/13/2018

               FOB:  PAGE: 4 of 6

ITEM NO. QTY. PRICE MAKE MODEL DELIVERY

1. 7 27,530.00 RAM

2500 Crew Cab     

4 X 4 7/25/2018

2. 12 27,530.00 RAM

2500 Crew Cab     

4 X 4 7/25/2018

3. 1 25,136.00 RAM

2500 Crew Cab     

4 X 2 7/25/2018

4. 1 24,572.00 RAM

2500 Crew Cab     

4 X 2 LWB 7/25/2018

5. 1 27,701.00 RAM

2500 Crew Cab     

4 X 4 LWB 7/25/2018

6. 1 35,756.00 RAM

2500 Crew Cab     

4 X 4 7/25/2018

7. 1 NO BID

CARD: 00-25

TENTATIVE AWARD BY: DATE: 3/13/2018

ITEM(S):

Purchasing Committee

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD 27,701.00$                                  

VENDOR:  

Red River Dodge Chjrysler Jeep LLC

1060 Heber Springs Rd South

Heber Springs, AR 72543

Mike Haley 501-362-5831

mike@redriverdodge.com

Little Rock, AR

2/13/2019

2/13/2019

ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES

2/13/2019

2/13/2019

2/13/2019

2/13/2019

TOTAL:  

AWARDED TO:

636,235.00

Item 5

Red River Dodge (3/22/2018)

24,572.00                                          

25,136.00                                          

330,360.00                                        

192,710.00                                        

EXTENSION

35,756.00                                          

27,701.00                                          

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION

ARDOT TABULATION

Pickups 3/4 Ton

mailto:mike@redriverdodge.com


Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DESCRIPTION:

CONTRACT NO.:  H-18-236H DATE OPENED: 2/13/2018

               FOB:  PAGE: 5 of 6

Steve Landers Chrysler Dodge Jeep

ITEM NO. QTY. PRICE MAKE MODEL DELIVERY

1. 7 NO BID

2. 12 27,532.00 RAM

2018 2500            

Crew Cab 90 Days ARO

3. 1 25,010.00 RAM

2018 2500            

Crew Cab 90 Days ARO

4. 1 24,446.00 RAM

2018 2500            

Crew Cab 90 Days ARO

5. 1 27,703.00 RAM

2018 2500            

Crew Cab 90 Days ARO

6. 1 35,713.00 RAM

2018 2500            

Crew Cab 90 Days ARO

7. 1 NO BID

CARD: 00-25

TENTATIVE AWARD BY: DATE: 3/13/2018

ITEM(S):

Purchasing Committee

TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD 24,446.00$                                  

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION

ARDOT TABULATION

Pickups 3/4 Ton

Little Rock, AR

2018 Fleet Cut off

2018 Fleet Cut off

VENDOR:  

401 Colonel Glenn Plaza Loop

Little Rock, AR 72210

Rick Layton 501-680-2359

rick.layton@landerscorp.com

EXTENSION

330,384.00                                        

25,010.00                                          

24,446.00                                          

TOTAL:  

AWARDED TO:

443,256.00

2018 Fleet Cut off

2018 Fleet Cut off

27,703.00                                          

35,713.00                                          

Item 4

Steve Landers Chrysler Dodge (3/23/2018)

ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES

2018 Fleet Cut off

mailto:rick.layton@landerscorp.com


Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DESCRIPTION:

CONTRACT NO.:  H-18-236H DATE OPENED: 2/13/2018

               FOB:  PAGE: 6 of 6

ITEM NO. QTY. PRICE MAKE MODEL DELIVERY

1. 7 NO BID

2. 12 27,723.00 RAM 2018 2500 120 Days

3. 1 24,991.00 RAM 2018 2500 120 Days

4. 1 NO BID

5. 1 NO BID

6. 1 NO BID

7. 1 NO BID

CARD: 00-25

TENTATIVE AWARD BY: DATE:

ITEM(S):

EXTENSION ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES

332,676.00                                        As Manufacturer Allows

24,991.00                                          As Manufacturer Allows

TOTAL:  357,667.00

AWARDED TO:

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION

ARDOT TABULATION

Pickups 3/4 Ton

Little Rock, AR

VENDOR:  

Cavenaugh CDJR

113 East Main Street

Walnut Ridge, AR 72476

Stephanie Johnson 870-886-2414

sjohnson@cavauto.group

mailto:sjohnson@cavauto.group

