

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - TABULATION

DESCRIPTION:

Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

Mineral Aggregate Class 2

BID NO.: M-18-032J

DATE OPENED: 4/3/2018

FOB: (D-9) - Marion, Searcy, Baxter,
Carroll, Boone, Newton (4) & Benton Co.

PAGE: 1 of 2

DELIVERY: Within 60 days from date of award

			APAC - Central, Inc. 755 E. Millsap Rd. Fayetteville, AR 72703 Ted Craft PH: 479-788-6342		Duffield Gravel Company 16 Bluff Drive Russellville, AR 72802 David Duffield PH: 479-967-5565		North Central Arkansas Quarry, Inc. P O Box 1570 Mtn. Home, AR 72654 Mike Dilbeck PH: 870-424-3839	
ALL OR NONE:								
BIDDING:								
ITEM NO.	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	EXTENSION	UNIT	EXTENSION	UNIT	EXTENSION
1.	1,081	Marion Co., Hwy 125		No Bid		No Bid	24.50	26,484.50
2.	1,143	Searcy Co., Hwy 65		No Bid		No Bid	26.00	29,718.00
3.	1,082	Baxter Co., Hwy 341		No Bid		No Bid	22.20	24,020.40
4.	1,629	Carroll Co., Hwy 23	20.50	33,394.50		No Bid		No Bid
5.	794	Boone Co., Sparrow Drive	31.50	25,011.00		No Bid	28.00	22,232.00
6.	1,102	Newton Co., Hwy 21	32.50	35,815.00	34.00	37,468.00		No Bid
7.	524	Newton Co., Hwy 21	32.50	17,030.00	35.00	18,340.00		No Bid
8.	887	Benton Co., Hwy 43	27.75	24,614.25		No Bid		No Bid
9.	1,084	Newton Co., Hwy 7	39.50	42,818.00	27.55	29,864.20		No Bid
10.	88	Newton Co., Hwy 7	39.50	3,476.00	27.55	2,424.40		No Bid
TOTAL:				182,158.75		88,096.60		102,454.90
RECOMMENDED AWARD:				86,239.50		32,288.60		72,736.90

TENTATIVELY AWARDED BY: Purchasing Committee

DATE: 4/11/2018

CARD: 05-09

AWARDED TO: APAC - Central, Inc. (4/11/18)

ITEM(S): 4, 6 & 7 only

AWARDED TO: Duffield Gravel Company (4/11/18)

ITEM(S): 9 & 10 only

AWARDED TO: L & N Quarry, Inc. (4/11/18)

ITEM(S): 2 only

AWARDED TO: Benton County Stone (4/11/18)

ITEM(S): 8 only

AWARDED TO: North Central Arkansas Quarry, Inc. (4/25/18)

ITEM(S): 1, 3 & 5 only

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - TABULATION

Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DESCRIPTION:

Mineral Aggregate Class 2

BID NO.: M-18-032J

DATE OPENED: 4/3/2018

FOB: (D-9) - Marion, Searcy, Baxter,
Carroll, Boone, Newton (4) & Benton Co.

PAGE: 2 of 2

DELIVERY: Within 60 days from date of award

			L & N Quarry, Inc. P O Box 1045 Mtn. View, AR 72560 Flynn Norman PH: 870-269-4500		Benton County Stone P O Box 988 Pryor, OK 74362 Jerry A. Arnold PH: 918-825-3370			
ALL OR NONE:								
BIDDING:								
ITEM NO.	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	EXTENSION	UNIT	EXTENSION	UNIT	EXTENSION
1.	1,081	Marion Co., Hwy 125		No Bid		No Bid		
2.	1,143	Searcy Co., Hwy 65	23.00	26,289.00		No Bid		
3.	1,082	Baxter Co., Hwy 341	27.00	29,214.00		No Bid		
4.	1,629	Carroll Co., Hwy 23		No Bid		No Bid		
5.	794	Boone Co., Sparrow Drive		No Bid		No Bid		
6.	1,102	Newton Co., Hwy 21		No Bid		No Bid		
7.	524	Newton Co., Hwy 21		No Bid		No Bid		
8.	887	Benton Co., Hwy 43		No Bid	17.50	15,522.50		
9.	1,084	Newton Co., Hwy 7		No Bid		No Bid		
10.	88	Newton Co., Hwy 7		No Bid		No Bid		
TOTAL:				55,503.00		15,522.50		
RECOMMENDED AWARD:				26,289.00		15,522.50		