
DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

BID NO.:  M-18-036J DATE OPENED:  4/3/2018

PAGE:  1 OF 2
DELIVERY:  Montgomery (2), Van Buren, Yell (2) & Searcy Co.

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

248,641.10 263,157.70 113,788.60            

RECOMMENDED AWARD: 115,908.30 79,420.60
TENTATIVELY AWARDED BY:  DATE:  CARD: 05-08

AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  

AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  

AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  

No Bid

15. 290 Van Buren Co., Hwy 254

41.00

37.00 31.0810,730.00              

7.

No Bid35.00

13. 410

33,138.00              

15,655.00              

15,889.40              32.76

24,624.60              

No Bid

320

620

37.26

40,845.00              

21,285.00              

Yell co., Hwy 307 29.98

1, 3, 8, 10, 11, 13 & 14 only

43.50Montgomery Co., Hwy 270

Purchasing Committee

Pope Co., Hwy 27 10,198.40              

4/11/2018

11,923.20              

Duffield Gravel Company (4/11/18)

17,835.00              

No Bid

31.56

No Bid

43.76 35,883.20              No Bid

No Bid

42.76 44,898.00              9. 1,050 Searcy Co., Hwy 27 38.90

8. 660

TOTAL:

17,362.80              10. 530

No Bid

11. 490

31.87

Yell Co., Hwy 10 32.25 37.31

5,688.80                

Van Buren Co., Hwy 336 25.25

39.996. 130

Montgomery Co., Hwy 88

Montgomery Co., Hwy 270 5,198.70                43.76

No Bid

29.35 19,371.00              33.76 22,281.60              

44,450.00              

1. 610 Conway Co., Hwy 9 29.64                18,080.40              

32,791.80              39.995. 820

No Bid

Duffield Gravel Company

33.99 43,167.30              

Paragould, AR  72450
John Bennett  PH:  870-573-6882

HardRock Construction, Inc.

9,385.20                

No Bid

17,683.90              

BIDDING:  
ALL OR NONE:  

Russellville, AR  72802
David Duffield  PH:  479-967-5565 Michael C. Sutterfield  PH:  479-967-1568

P O Box 9286
Russellville, AR  72811

16 Bluff Drive

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
ARDOT - TABULATION

Mineral Aggregate Class 4

             FOB:  (D-8) -Conway, Faulkner, Johnson (2),
Within 60 days from date of award

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc. 
11719 Hwy 412 West

3. 660 Johnson Co., I-40 Exit 64

DESCRIPTION

28.99

4. 1,270

2. 330 Faulkner Co., Hwy 310

Johnson Co., I-40 Exit 47

28.44No Bid

32.71 19,953.10              

12. 430 Faulkner Co., Hwy 310

37.26Conway Co., Hwy 113

14.

29.94

9,013.20                

14,670.60              18,257.40              16,287.60              

No Bid 28.44 12,229.20              

No Bid

No Bid16,810.00              

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc. (4/11/18) 2, 7, 9, 12 & 15 only

APAC - Central, Inc. (4/11/18) 4, 5 & 6 only

33.24



DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017
BID NO.:  M-18-036J DATE OPENED:  4/3/2018

PAGE:  2 OF 2
DELIVERY:  Montgomery (2), Van Buren, Yell (2) & Searcy Co.

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

131,134.00 60,624.70

RECOMMENDED AWARD: 70,801.00

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
ARDOT - TABULATION

Mineral Aggregate Class 4

             FOB:  (D-8) -Conway, Faulkner, Johnson (2),
Within 60 days from date of award

APAC - Central, Inc. River Valley Quarries
755 E. Millsap Rd. P O Box 988
Fayetteville, AR  72703 Pryor, OK  74362
Ted Craft  PH:  479-788-6342 Jerry A. Arnold  PH:  918-825-3370

ALL OR NONE:  
BIDDING:  

DESCRIPTION

1. 610 Conway Co., Hwy 9 No Bid No Bid

2. 330 Faulkner Co., Hwy 310 No Bid No Bid

3. 660 Johnson Co., I-40 Exit 64 31.25 20,625.00              33.07 21,826.20              

4. 1,270 Johnson Co., I-40 Exit 47 27.90 35,433.00              30.55 38,798.50              

5. 820 Montgomery Co., Hwy 88 37.25 30,545.00              No Bid

6. 130 Montgomery Co., Hwy 270 37.10 4,823.00                

7. 620 Van Buren Co., Hwy 336 No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

8. 660 Yell Co., Hwy 10 32.70 21,582.00              

34.20 18,126.00              

9. 1,050 Searcy Co., Hwy 27 No Bid

11. 490 Conway Co., Hwy 113 No Bid No Bid

10. 530

12. 430 Faulkner Co., Hwy 310 No Bid

13. 410 Montgomery Co., Hwy 270 No Bid

14. 320 Pope Co., Hwy 27 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL:

15. 290 Van Buren Co., Hwy 254 No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No BidYell co., Hwy 307


	Short Tab

