

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant and Hot Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-20-208H

Date of Contract: July 1, 2019 thru September 30, 2019 Opening Date: June 4, 2019

| BIDDERS | ACHM Base Course SECTION 405 | | | ACHM Binder Course SECTION 406 | | | ACHM Surface Course SECTION 407 | | | | | | ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate SECTION 407 | | | | | | Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant Mix SECTION 411 | | (9) | | | |
|---|--|----------|----------|--------------------------------|----------|----------|---------------------------------|----------|----------|-----------|----------|----------|---|----------|----------|-----------|----------|----------|---|----------|-----|----------|----------------|--------------|
| | (1) (37.5) | | | (2) (25.0) | | | (3) (12.5) | | | (4) (9.5) | | | (5) (12.5) | | | (6) (9.5) | | | (7) | (8) | | | | |
| | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | | PG 76-22 | MC-800 Cutback | Summer Grade |
| APAC-Central, Inc. Barling, AR Preston 479-788-6342 | | | | | | | * | * | | * | * | | | | | | | | | | | * | | ** |
| APAC-Central, Inc. Barling, AR Jenny Lind 479-788-6342 | | | | | | | * | * | | * | * | | | | | | | | | | | * | | ** |
| APAC-Central, Inc. Barling, AR Centerton 479-788-6342 | Not on Qualified Products List - No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| APAC-Central, Inc. Barling, AR Sharps 479-788-6342 | | | | | | | * | * | | * | * | | | | | | | | | | | * | | ** |
| APAC-Central, Inc. Barling, AR Valley Springs 479-788-6342 | | | | | | | * | | | * | | | | | | | | | | | | | | ** |
| APAC-Central, Inc. Barling, AR West Fork 479-788-6342 | Not on Qualified Products List - No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| APAC-Mississippi, Inc. Jackson, MS Greenville, MS 662-378-8481 | No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |

code 00-09

**** SEE ATTACHED SHEET**
***SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY**
+ORDERS FOR A MINIMUM TONNAGE MAY BE REQUIRED
#4 week lead time required on Hot Mix Asphalt Orders to allow for mix design.

Tentatively Awarded By: Purchase Committee DATE: June 26, 2019

Awarded To: As Per Tabulation

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION

ARDOT - Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant and Hot Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-20-208H

Date of Contract: July 1, 2019 thru September 30, 2019

Opening Date: June 4, 2019

| BIDDERS | ACHM Base Course SECTION 405 | | | ACHM Binder Course SECTION 406 | | | ACHM Surface Course SECTION 407 | | | | | | ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate SECTION 407 | | | | | | Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant Mix SECTION 411 | | (10) | | | | |
|---|--|----------|----------|--------------------------------|----------|----------|---------------------------------|----------|----------|-----------|----------|----------|---|----------|----------|-----------|----------|----------|---|----------|------|----------|----------------|--------------|---------------------------|
| | (1) (37.5) | | | (2) (25.0) | | | (3) (12.5) | | | (4) (9.5) | | | (5) (12.5) | | | (6) (9.5) | | | (7) | (8) | | | | | |
| | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | | PG 76-22 | MC-800 Cutback | Summer Grade | Haul Price |
| APAC-Tennessee, Inc. Memphis, TN Forrest City, AR 870-630-1290 | 65.00 | 70.00 | 75.00 | 65.00 | 70.00 | 75.00 | 70.00 | 72.00 | 80.00 | 73.00 | 78.00 | 82.00 | 70.00 | 72.00 | 80.00 | 73.00 | 78.00 | 82.00 | | | | | | | |
| APAC-Tennessee, Inc. Memphis, TN Memphis, TN 901-942-1800 | No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| APAC-Tennessee, Inc. Memphis, TN West Memphis, AR 870-735-2880 | No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| APAC-Tennessee, Inc. Memphis, TN Wynne, AR 901-947-5600 | Not on Qualified Products List - No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Asphalt Producers, LLC Jonesboro, AR Valley View 870-932-1306 | 44.92 | | | 47.50 | | | 54.45 | 58.50 | | 57.12 | | | 54.20 | | | 56.87 | | | | | | | | | .25/tn mile w/4.00 min |
| Asphalt Producers, LLC Jonesboro, AR Brinkley 870-932-1306 | Not on Qualified Products List | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Asphalt Products, LLC Little Rock, AR - Plant #1 Redstone Plant 501-490-0718 | 60.00 | 64.00 | 73.00 | 62.00 | 67.00 | 73.00 | 64.00 | 69.00 | 74.00 | 68.00 | 72.00 | 78.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | |

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant and Hot Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-20-208H

Date of Contract: July 1, 2019 thru September 30, 2019 Opening Date: June 4, 2019

| BIDDERS | ACHM Base Course SECTION 405 | | | ACHM Binder Course SECTION 406 | | | ACHM Surface Course SECTION 407 | | | | | | ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate SECTION 407 | | | | | | Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant Mix SECTION 411 | | (10) | | | |
|--|--|-------------|-------------|--------------------------------|-------------|-------------|---------------------------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|---|-------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|---|-------------|------|-------------|-------------------|---------------------------|
| | (1) (37.5) | | | (2) (25.0) | | | (3) (12.5) | | | (4) (9.5) | | | (5) (12.5) | | | (6) (9.5) | | | (7) | (8) | | | | |
| | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | | PG 76-22 | MC-800 Cutback | Summer Grade |
| Asphalt Products, LLC Little Rock, AR - Redstone Plant Gurdon 501-490-0718 | 64.75 | 68.60 | 71.45 | 67.45 | 71.80 | 75.70 | 73.20 | 77.70 | 82.70 | 77.50 | 84.75 | 87.60 | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (1) Batesville, AR Rose Bud 870-251-2371 | | 60.98 | | 60.75 | 64.75 | | 64.27 | 67.25 | | 66.75 | 70.72 | 72.58 | | | | | | | | | | 115.00 | | .25/tn mile w/4.00 min |
| Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (1) Batesville, AR Mountain View 870-269-7222 | | | | 58.93 | | | 70.48 | 73.86 | | 72.17 | | | | | | | | | | | | 115.00 | | .25/tn mile w/4.00 min |
| Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (1) Batesville, AR Midwest Lane 870-793-4581 | 57.58 | 60.12 | | 58.45 | 61.14 | | 62.86 | 65.58 | 72.05 | 63.81 | | | | | | | | 60.21 | | | | 115.00 | | .25/tn mile w/4.00 min |
| Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (1) Batesville, AR Violet Hill 870-251-2371 | Not on Qualified Products List - No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (2) Jonesboro, AR 102 Bearden Dr., Jonesboro, AR 870-932-1246 | 52.93 | 56.24 | | 53.33 | 57.56 | | 55.34 | 58.52 | 61.72 | 59.43 | | | | | | | | 55.09 | | | | | | .25/tn mile w/4.00 min |
| Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (2) Jonesboro, AR Black Rock, AR 870-932-1246 | Not on Qualified Products List - No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (2) Jonesboro, AR McCrary Plant 870-731-5000 | | | | | | | 68.19 | 71.78 | | 70.64 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | .25/tn mile w/4.00 min |
| Blackstone Const., LLC Russellville, AR Plant 1 & 3 479-968-1149 | * | * | * | * | * | * | * | * | * | * | * | * | | | | | | | | | | * | | .30/tn mile w/4.00min. |
| C.K. Asphalt, LLC Quitman, AR Rose Bud 501-556-0763 | | 60.00 | | | 61.00 | | 59.00 | 65.50 | | 64.00 | 74.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | .27/tn mile |

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant and Hot Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-20-208H

Date of Contract: July 1, 2019 thru September 30, 2019 Opening Date: June 4, 2019

| BIDDERS | ACHM Base Course SECTION 405 | | | ACHM Binder Course SECTION 406 | | | ACHM Surface Course SECTION 407 | | | | | | ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate SECTION 407 | | | | | | Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant Mix SECTION 411 | | (10) | | | |
|---|--|-------------|-------------|--------------------------------|-------------|-------------|---------------------------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|---|-------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|---|-------------|------|-------------|-------------------|-----------------|
| | (1) (37.5) | | | (2) (25.0) | | | (3) (12.5) | | | (4) (9.5) | | | (5) (12.5) | | | (6) (9.5) | | | (7) | (8) | | | | |
| | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | | PG 76-22 | MC-800 Cutback | Summer Grade |
| Covington Enterprises., Inc. Rogers, AR Bentonville, AR 479-795-1133 | No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Cranford Construction Co. No.Little Rock, AR Bryant/Bauxite, AR 501-945-7176 | 60.75 | 66.75 | 71.75 | 62.75 | 67.25 | 73.75 | 65.00 | 69.25 | 75.75 | 68.75 | 73.25 | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Cranford Construction Co. No.Little Rock, AR Hope, AR 501-945-7176 | Not on Qualified Products List - No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Cranford Construction Co. No.Little Rock, AR Little Rock, AR 501-945-7176 | 60.75 | 66.75 | 71.75 | 62.75 | 67.25 | 73.75 | 65.00 | 69.25 | 75.75 | 68.75 | 73.25 | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Cranford Construction Co. Malvern, AR Jones Mill 501-945-7176 | 67.75 | 71.60 | 74.45 | 70.45 | 74.80 | 78.70 | 76.20 | 80.70 | 85.70 | 80.55 | 87.75 | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Cranford Construction Co. No.Little Rock, AR No.Little Rock, AR 501-945-7176 | 60.75 | 66.75 | 71.75 | 62.75 | 67.25 | 73.75 | 65.00 | 69.25 | 75.75 | 68.75 | 73.25 | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Delta Asphalt of Arkansas Paragould, AR Ash Flat, AR 870-573-6882 | Not on Qualified Products List | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Delta Asphalt of Arkansas Paragould, AR Black Rock, AR 870-878-6307 | No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant and Hot Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-20-208H

Date of Contract: July 1, 2019 thru September 30, 2019 Opening Date: June 4, 2019

| BIDDERS | ACHM Base Course SECTION 405 | | | ACHM Binder Course SECTION 406 | | | ACHM Surface Course SECTION 407 | | | | | | ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate SECTION 407 | | | | | | Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant Mix SECTION 411 | | | | | |
|--|--|----------|----------|--------------------------------|----------|----------|---------------------------------|----------|----------|-----------|----------|----------|---|----------|----------|-----------|----------|----------|---|----------|----------|----------------|--------------|---------------------------|
| | (1) (37.5) | | | (2) (25.0) | | | (3) (12.5) | | | (4) (9.5) | | | (5) (12.5) | | | (6) (9.5) | | | (7) | (8) | (10) | | | |
| | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | MC-800 Cutback | Summer Grade | Haul Price |
| Delta Asphalt of Arkansas Paragould, AR Bee Branch - Clinton 501-745-3693 | | | | 58.00 | | | 62.50 | 66.00 | | 63.00 | 72.00 | | | | | | | | | | | 95.00 | | .27/tn mile w/4.00 min |
| Delta Asphalt of Arkansas Paragould, AR Judsonia, AR 501-729-4601 | | | | 58.00 | | | 62.50 | 66.00 | | 63.00 | 72.00 | | | | | | | | | | | 95.00 | | .27/tn mile w/4.00 min |
| Delta Asphalt of Arkansas Paragould, AR Luxora, AR 870-658-2543 | | | | 65.00 | | | 65.00 | 72.00 | | 67.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | 95.00 | | .27/tn mile w/4.00 min |
| Delta Asphalt of Arkansas Paragould, AR Paragould, AR 870-573-6262 | | | | 50.00 | | | 55.00 | 65.00 | | 58.25 | | | 52.00 | | | 55.00 | | | | | | 95.00 | | .27/tn mile w/4.00 min |
| Delta Asphalt of Arkansas Paragould, AR Tuckerman, AR 870-349-2995 | Not on Qualified Products List - No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| R. K. Hall Construction LLC Paris, TX Kirby, AR 903-559-1276 | Not on Qualified Products List - No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| R. K. Hall Construction LLC Paris, TX DeQueen, AR 903-559-1276 | 75.00 | 81.00 | 85.00 | 75.00 | 81.00 | 85.00 | 79.00 | 84.00 | 89.00 | 82.00 | 89.00 | 94.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | .27/tn mile w/6.00 min |
| R. K. Hall Construction LLC Paris, TX Texarkana, AR 903-559-1276 | 75.00 | 81.00 | 85.00 | 75.00 | 81.00 | 85.00 | 79.00 | 84.00 | 89.00 | 81.00 | 86.00 | 91.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | .27/tn mile w/6.00 min |

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant and Hot Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-20-208H

Date of Contract: July 1, 2019 thru September 30, 2019 Opening Date: June 4, 2019

| BIDDERS | ACHM Base Course SECTION 405 | | | ACHM Binder Course SECTION 406 | | | ACHM Surface Course SECTION 407 | | | | | | ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate SECTION 407 | | | | | | Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant Mix SECTION 411 | | | | | | | |
|---|--|-------------|-------------|--------------------------------|-------------|-------------|---------------------------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|---|-------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|---|-------------|-------------|-------------------|-----------------|------------|-----------------|--|
| | (1) (37.5) | | | (2) (25.0) | | | (3) (12.5) | | | (4) (9.5) | | | (5) (12.5) | | | (6) (9.5) | | | (7) | (8) | (10) | | | | | |
| | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | MC-800 Cutback | Summer Grade | Haul Price | | |
| Hutchens Construction Co. Cassville, MO Berryville, AR 870-423-1003 | No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Hutchens Construction Co. Cassville, MO Sonora Plant, Springdale, AR 479-365-6610 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Hutchens Construction Co. (Material Depot) Springdale, AR (Recycle Plant for Roofing Shingles & Wrap Only) 479-927-0257 | Not on Qualified Products List - No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Hutchens Construction Co. Gateway/Seligman Asphalt Plant Seligman, MO 479-927-0257 | No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Hutchens Construction Co. Cassville, MO Gravette, AR 479-298-0052 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Jay-Pac, Inc. Morrliton, AR Hixon Road, Plummerville, AR 501-354-4175 | | | | 64.00 | 68.00 | | 71.00 | 74.00 | | 71.00 | 75.00 | 79.00 | | | | | | | | | | | 98.00 | | .30/tn per mile | |
| Jet Asphalt & Rock Co., Inc. El Dorado, AR East Camden, AR 870-574-1840 | No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Jet Asphalt & Rock Co., Inc. El Dorado, AR Eagle Mills-Bearden, AR 870-574-0691 | 66.00 | 70.00 | | 68.00 | 72.00 | | 72.00 | 75.00 | 80.00 | 75.00 | 80.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

** SEE ATTACHED SHEET

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant and Hot Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-20-208H

Date of Contract: July 1, 2019 thru September 30, 2019 Opening Date: June 4, 2019

| BIDDERS | ACHM Base Course SECTION 405 | | | ACHM Binder Course SECTION 406 | | | ACHM Surface Course SECTION 407 | | | | | | ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate SECTION 407 | | | | | | Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant Mix SECTION 411 | | | | | |
|---|--|----------|----------|--------------------------------|----------|----------|---------------------------------|----------|----------|-----------|----------|----------|---|----------|----------|-----------|----------|----------|---|----------|----------|----------------|--------------|------------|
| | (1) (37.5) | | | (2) (25.0) | | | (3) (12.5) | | | (4) (9.5) | | | (5) (12.5) | | | (6) (9.5) | | | (7) | (8) | (10) | | | |
| | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | MC-800 Cutback | Summer Grade | Haul Price |
| Jet Asphalt & Rock Co., Inc. El Dorado, AR Fordyce, AR 870-352-0375 | 66.00 | 70.00 | | 68.00 | 72.00 | | 72.00 | 75.00 | 80.00 | 75.00 | 80.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Jet Asphalt & Rock Co., Inc. El Dorado, AR El Dorado, AR 870-863-7801 | 66.00 | 70.00 | | 68.00 | 72.00 | | 72.00 | 75.00 | 80.00 | 75.00 | 80.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| JoB Const. Co., Inc. Poteau , OK Poteau , OK Yard 918-647-8284 | Not on Qualified Products List - No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Lehman-Roberts Co. 2840 Carrier Rd., Memphis, TN Memphis, TN 901-482-1755 | No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| North Central Arkansas Quarry Inc. Mountain Home, AR 870-424-3839 | No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel Co. Pine Bluff, AR Monticello - Plant #2 870-534-7120 or 870-541-8058 | * | * | | * | * | | * | * | * | * | * | * | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel Co. Pine Bluff, AR Kansas Street & River- Plant #1 870-534-7120 | 74.00 | 79.00 | | 74.00 | 82.00 | | 77.50 | 83.50 | 89.00 | 82.00 | 92.00 | 94.50 | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel Co. Pine Bluff, AR Kansas Street & River- Plant #1 870-534-7120 | * | * | | * | * | | * | * | * | * | * | * | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel Co. Pine Bluff, AR Kansas Street & River- Plant #1 870-534-7120 | 69.50 | 75.00 | | 68.50 | 77.00 | | 70.00 | 79.00 | 82.00 | 79.50 | 87.00 | 91.50 | | | | | | | | | | | | |

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

**ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant and Hot Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-20-208H**

Date of Contract: July 1, 2019 thru September 30, 2019 Opening Date: June 4, 2019

| BIDDERS | ACHM Base Course SECTION 405 | | | ACHM Binder Course SECTION 406 | | | ACHM Surface Course SECTION 407 | | | | | | ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate SECTION 407 | | | | | | Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant Mix SECTION 411 | | | |
|---|--|----------|----------|--------------------------------|----------|----------|---------------------------------|----------|----------|-----------|----------|----------|---|----------|----------|-----------|----------|----------|---|--------------|------------|------------------------------|
| | (1) (37.5) | | | (2) (25.0) | | | (3) (12.5) | | | (4) (9.5) | | | (5) (12.5) | | | (6) (9.5) | | | (7) | (8) | (10) | |
| | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | PG 64-22 | PG 70-22 | PG 76-22 | MC-800 Cutback | Summer Grade | Haul Price | |
| Rogers Group, Inc. Conway, AR Conway, AR 501-329-8360 | Not on Qualified Products List - No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Rogers Group, Inc. Conway, AR Greenbrier, AR 501-679-6230 | 59.00 | 62.00 | 69.00 | 59.00 | 65.00 | 71.00 | 63.00 | 67.00 | 74.00 | 66.00 | 72.00 | 74.00 | | | | | | | | 120.00 | | .30/tn per mile w/\$3.75 min |
| Rogers Group, Inc. Conway, AR Cabot, AR 501-843-5154 | 60.00 | 63.00 | 70.00 | 60.00 | 66.00 | 72.00 | 64.00 | 68.00 | 75.00 | 67.00 | 73.00 | 75.00 | | | | | | | | 120.00 | | .30/tn per mile w/\$3.75 min |
| Rogers Group Inc. Conway, AR Springfield, AR 501-477-2106 | Not on Qualified Products List - No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Rogers Group Inc. Conway, AR El Paso, AR 501-796-2323 | Not on Qualified Products List - No Bid Received | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Twin Lakes Quarry's Mountain Home, AR Mountain Home, AR 870-425-4510 | | | | | | | 57.00 | | | 58.00 | | | | | | | | | | | | .35/tn per mile |

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

APAC CENTRAL, INC.
DUMP TRUCK MILEAGE HAUL RATES
Effective: Apr 1, 2019 thru Sep 30, 2019

Sharps, Valley Springs, Hindsville, Avoca, Gravette & Bella Vista Plants

| MILES | Rate | Rip Rap |
|---------|--------|---------|
| 0-10 | \$0.35 | \$0.45 |
| 11-20 | \$0.35 | \$0.45 |
| 21-30 | \$0.25 | \$0.35 |
| Over 30 | \$0.25 | \$0.35 |

Note: All haul rate quotes are on a per-ton mile basis and are rounded to the nearest mile to the delivery site.

\$2.50/ton minimum haul rate.

APAC CENTRAL, INC.
DUMP TRUCK MILEAGE HAUL RATES
Effective: Apr 1, 2019 thru Sep 30, 2019
Jenny Lind, Preston, Midland & Van Buren Sand Plant

| MILES | PER TON RATE | MILES | PER TON RATE |
|-------|--------------|-------|--------------|
| 0-6 | \$3.15 | 31 | \$7.05 |
| 7-12 | \$3.60 | 32 | \$7.25 |
| 13 | \$3.80 | 33 | \$7.50 |
| 14 | \$3.90 | 34 | \$7.70 |
| 15 | \$4.10 | 35 | \$7.95 |
| 16 | \$4.25 | 36 | \$8.05 |
| 17 | \$4.30 | 37 | \$8.20 |
| 18 | \$4.50 | 38 | \$8.40 |
| 19 | \$4.60 | 39 | \$8.55 |
| 20 | \$4.75 | 40 | \$8.75 |
| 21 | \$4.95 | 41 | \$8.95 |
| 22 | \$5.20 | 42 | \$9.10 |
| 23 | \$5.40 | 43 | \$9.30 |
| 24 | \$5.65 | 44 | \$9.40 |
| 25 | \$5.85 | 45 | \$9.60 |
| 26 | \$6.05 | 46 | \$9.70 |
| 27 | \$6.25 | 47 | \$9.90 |
| 28 | \$6.50 | 48 | \$10.05 |
| 29 | \$6.65 | 49 | \$10.25 |
| 30 | \$6.85 | 50 | \$10.40 |

51 Miles & Over 0.2075per ton mile

Add \$1.00 per ton for Cold Mix or Hot Mix

Add \$2.00 per ton for 18" Rip rap

20 ton Minimum haul charge



Main Office: 1007 Main Street - Cassville, MO 65625
 phone (417) 847-2489 - Fax (417) 847-5561
 Toll Free (888) PAVEIT2 - (888) 728-3482

www.hutchensconstruction.com

| | Rock | Asphalt | | Rock | Asphalt | | Rock | Asphalt | | Rock | Asphalt | | | |
|----|------|---------|--|------|---------|------|------|---------|-------|-------|---------|----|-------|-------|
| 1 | 1.61 | 1.92 | | 17 | 4.95 | 5.78 | | 33 | 8.27 | 9.64 | | 49 | 11.60 | 13.46 |
| 2 | 1.82 | 2.16 | | 18 | 5.14 | 6.02 | | 34 | 8.45 | 9.85 | | 50 | 11.79 | 13.70 |
| 3 | 2.01 | 2.42 | | 19 | 5.34 | 6.25 | | 35 | 8.68 | 10.12 | | 51 | 12.00 | 13.95 |
| 4 | 2.23 | 2.67 | | 20 | 5.55 | 6.49 | | 36 | 8.89 | 10.35 | | 52 | 12.22 | 14.21 |
| 5 | 2.44 | 2.87 | | 21 | 5.77 | 6.73 | | 37 | 9.11 | 10.59 | | 53 | 12.43 | 14.45 |
| 6 | 2.67 | 3.12 | | 22 | 5.96 | 6.97 | | 38 | 9.30 | 10.83 | | 54 | 12.62 | 14.69 |
| 7 | 2.85 | 3.38 | | 23 | 6.17 | 7.22 | | 39 | 9.51 | 11.08 | | 55 | 12.84 | 14.94 |
| 8 | 3.07 | 3.62 | | 24 | 6.38 | 7.46 | | 40 | 9.73 | 11.32 | | 56 | 13.05 | 15.15 |
| 9 | 3.29 | 3.86 | | 25 | 6.60 | 7.70 | | 41 | 9.94 | 11.54 | | 57 | 13.27 | 15.40 |
| 10 | 3.50 | 4.10 | | 26 | 6.79 | 7.92 | | 42 | 10.13 | 11.78 | | 58 | 13.46 | 15.64 |
| 11 | 3.69 | 4.35 | | 27 | 7.01 | 8.17 | | 43 | 10.35 | 12.03 | | 59 | 13.67 | 15.89 |
| 12 | 3.90 | 4.57 | | 28 | 7.22 | 8.41 | | 44 | 10.56 | 12.27 | | 60 | 13.90 | 16.13 |
| 13 | 4.11 | 4.81 | | 29 | 7.43 | 8.67 | | 45 | 10.78 | 12.51 | | 61 | 14.12 | 16.37 |
| 14 | 4.30 | 5.05 | | 30 | 7.62 | 8.91 | | 46 | 10.97 | 12.75 | | 62 | 14.31 | 16.61 |
| 15 | 4.52 | 5.30 | | 31 | 7.83 | 9.16 | | 47 | 11.18 | 13.00 | | 63 | 14.52 | 16.84 |
| 16 | 4.73 | 5.54 | | 32 | 8.05 | 9.40 | | 48 | 11.40 | 13.22 | | 64 | 14.74 | 17.08 |